
 

       
In-Person and Via Live Stream: Click Here   

Dial-In Live Stream: 312-626-6799; Webinar ID 885 4977 7104 Passcode: 147078 
 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE  
 
ROLL CALL 
 
APPROVAL OF THE MINUTES FROM THE NOVEMBER 24, 2025 REGULAR MEETING OF THE COUNCIL 
 
 
PUBLIC COMMENT: - emailed public comment can be sent to the deputy village clerk at 

mroach@forestpark.net prior to 6:30 p.m. the day of the meeting 
COMMUNICATIONS:   
 
DEPARTMENT REPORTS: 

 
BILLS BY RESOLUTION 
  
UNFINISHED BUSINESS:  
 
NEW BUSINESS: 
 

1. Presentation: Forest Park Arts Alliance 
2. Annual Tax Levy Ordinance of the Village of Forest Park, Cook County Illinois, for the Fiscal Year 

Beginning May 1, 2025 and Ending April 30, 2026  
3. Resolution Directing the County Clerk to Calculate Separate Limiting Rates for the tax levy 2025 
4. Ordinance amending Section 8-1-1, entitled “Building Codes Adoption,” of the Municipal Code 
5. Ordinance waiving bid, approving and authorizing the execution of a Maintenance Agreement with SEPS, 

Inc. for a Police Department Uninterrupted Power Supply (UPS) Unit 
6. Resolution approving and directing the Village Engineer to prepare and submit a Pre-Application for the 

MWRDGC Green Infrastructure Partnership Program 
7. Resolution approving the 2026 Agreement with Endeavor Edward-Elmhurst Occupational Health Services 

for a Substance Abuse Random Management Program 
8. Resolution authorizing and directing the transfer of funds from the Roosevelt Road/Harlem Avenue TIF 

District to the Roosevelt Road Corridor TIF District 
9. Resolution approving a 2026 Paratransit Service Provider Agreement between Suburban Bus Division of 

the Regional Transportation Authority (PACE) and the Village 
10. Resolution authorizing the approval of Pay Request #9 for the AMI Water Meters Replacement Project to 

Veregy Central, LLC 
11. Raffle Permit Application: Howard Mohr Community Center – Community Toy Drive 

 
 
ADMINISTRATOR’S REPORT 
COMMISSIONER REPORTS   
ADJOURN 
 

 
VILLAGE OF FOREST PARK 

 COUNCIL MEETING AGENDA 
Monday, December 15, 2025   

Lower Level of Village Hall 
7:00 PM 

https://us02web.zoom.us/j/88549777104?pwd=S5LI7a86l4cr851sMpQEX3FN9UV1wl.1
mailto:mroach@forestpark.net


THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE COUNCIL OF THE 
VILLAGE OF FOREST PARK, COOK COUNTY, ILLINOIS 

HELD ON MONDAY EVENING, NOVEMBER 24, 2025 
 
 

Mayor Hoskins led all assembled in the Pledge of Allegiance at 7:01 p.m.  
 

ROLL CALL 
 
Commissioners Maxham, Nero, Melin-Rogovin, Voogd and Mayor Hoskins answered the Roll Call.   
 

APPROVAL OF THE MINUTES OF PREVIOUS MEETINGS 
 

It was moved by Commissioner Maxham and seconded by Commissioner Nero that the minutes 
from the November 10, 2025, Regular Meeting of the Village Council be approved. 
 
ROLL CALL: 
AYES: Commissioners Maxham, Nero, Melin-Rogovin, Voogd and Mayor Hoskins 
NAYES: None 
ABSENT: None 
The motion carried. 
 
It was moved by Commissioner Maxham and seconded by Commissioner Nero that the minutes 
from the November 10, 2025, Closed Meeting of the Village Council be approved. 
 
ROLL CALL: 
AYES: Commissioners Maxham, Nero, Melin-Rogovin, Voogd and Mayor Hoskins 
NAYES: None 
ABSENT: None 
The motion carried. 
 
PUBLIC COMMENT 
 
Deputy Clerk Roach read an update from the Forest Park PTO updating the elected officials on how 
to contact PTO and upcoming events including Dine n Donate on December 8 from 4-8pm at 
Culver’s on Roosevelt Road. PTO also stated they need volunteers at the concession stand for 
FPMS basketball games. 
 
COMMUNICATIONS: 
 
None 
 
DEPARTMENT REPORTS: 
 
None 
 
APPROVAL OF BILLS: 
 
It was moved by Commissioner Maxham and seconded by 
Commissioner Nero that the Resolution for the payment of bills 
be adopted.  The bills totaled $1.796,716.49. 
 

 
R-119-25 

APPROVAL OF BILLS IN 
THE AMOUNT OF 

$1,796,716.49 
APPROVED 



 2 

ROLL CALL: 
AYES: Commissioners Maxham, Nero, Melin-Rogovin, 

Voogd and Mayor Hoskins 
NAYES: None 
ABSENT: None 
The motion carried unanimously. 

 
UNFINISHED BUSINESS: 
 
None 
 
NEW BUSINESS: 
 
It was moved by Commissioner Voogd and seconded by 
Commissioner Melin-Rogovin that an ordinance authorizing 
the sale or disposal of surplus property of the Village of Forest 
Park, 1 fire truck and 1 ambulance be adopted. 
 
ROLL CALL: 
AYES: Commissioners Maxham, Nero, Melin-Rogovin, 

Voogd and Mayor Hoskins  
NAYES: None 
ABSENT: None 
The motion carried unanimously. 
 
It was moved by Commissioner Maxham and seconded by 
Commissioner Nero that the Resolution estimating property 
taxes be levied for the 2025 tax year for the village of Forest 
Park be adopted. 
 
ROLL CALL: 
AYES: Commissioners Maxham, Nero, Melin-Rogovin, 

Voogd and Mayor Hoskins  
NAYES: None 
ABSENT: None 
The motion carried unanimously 
 
It was moved by Commissioner Melin-Rogovin and seconded 
by Commissioner Voogd that a Resolution approving and 
executing a professional engineering proposal for construction 
engineering for the 2025 leads service replacement line 
(LSLR) stage 3 with CBBEL and the Village of Forest Park be 
adopted. 
 
ROLL CALL: 
AYES: Commissioners Maxham, Nero, Melin-Rogovin, 

Voogd and Mayor Hoskins 
NAYES: None 
ABSENT: None 
The motion carried unanimously. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

O-50-25 
ORDINANCE APPROVING 
DISPOSAL OF SURPLUS 

VEHICLES 
APPROVED 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

R-120-25 
RESOLUTION ESTIMATING 

TAXES BE LEVIED FOR 
2025 

APPROVED 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

R-121-25 
RESOLUTION APPROVING 
ENGINEERING SERVICES 

CBBEL LSLR STAGE 3 
APPROVED 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 3 

It was moved by Commissioner Melin-Rogovin and seconded 
by Commissioner Voodg that the Resolution approving and 
authorizing Pay Request #1 for the 2025 LSLR stage 2 project 
to Five Star Energy be approved. 
 
ROLL CALL: 
AYES: Commissioners Maxham, Nero, Melin-Rogovin, 

Voogd and Mayor Hoskins 
NAYES: None 
ABSENT: None 
The motion carried unanimously 
 
It was moved by Commissioner Maxham and seconded by 
Commissioner Nero that the Resolution authorizing and and 
approving the execution of an application for a small 
equipment grant from the Office of the Illinois State Fire 
Marshall be adopted. 
 
ROLL CALL: 
AYES: Commissioners Maxham, Nero, Melin-Rogovin, 

Voogd and Mayor Hoskins 
NAYES: None 
ABSENT: None 
The motion carried unanimously 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

R-122-25 
RESOLUTION APPROVING 

PAY REQUEST #1 TO 
FIVESTAR ENERGY LLC 

APPROVED 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

R-123-25 
RESOLUTION 

AUTHORIZING 
APPLICATION FOR SMALL 

EQUIPMENT GRANT 
APPROVED 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 4 

  
ADMINISTRATOR’S REPORT: 
 
The Village Administrator reported attending an Emergency Operations Plan (EOP) emergency management 
crisis response session, which covered procedures for crises, weather events, and other emergencies. The 
Administrator reminded everyone that Village Hall will be closed on November 26 and 27 in observance of 
Thanksgiving. The Administrator also recognized Forest Park residents who attend Fenwick High School, 
noting that the Fenwick football team has qualified for the 6A state championship. Best wishes were extended 
to the team, including Commissioner Nero’s son, who plays for the Friars. 
 
COMMISSIONER’S REPORTS: 
 
Commissioner Maxham also congratulated Fenwick and Commissioner Nero’s son and wished everyone a 
Happy Thanksgiving. 
 
Commissioner Nero reported that he is finalizing zoning documents and will have them ready for review at the 
December meeting. He also recapped the recent Fenwick vs. Nazareth football game, noting that Fenwick won 
by one point in an exciting and significant upset. He wished the Friars good luck in their upcoming game. 
 
Commissioner Melin-Rogovin reported that the Traffic & Safety Commission will hold a public meeting in 
February 2026 to discuss ongoing traffic and safety concerns within the Village. She reminded residents about 
Operation Rising Spirit, encouraging everyone to write holiday cards to veterans. Events will be held on 
December 4 from 6–8 p.m. at Jimmy’s Place and on December 10 at 1 p.m. at the library. She also expressed 
her excitement for the upcoming Holiday Walk and encouraged the community to support small local 
businesses. Finally, she thanked Village staff and first responders for their continued hard work and dedication. 
 
Commissioner Voogd reported that the Pumpkin Smash event was a great success, with 1.22 tons of 
pumpkins collected for composting. She thanked everyone who helped make the event possible and wished all 
residents a happy Thanksgiving. 
 
Mayor Hoskins echoed the earlier comments and reports, wished everyone a happy Thanksgiving, and 
expressed his appreciation for Village staff and all who volunteer in the community. He also thanked the Public 
Works Department for the beautiful holiday lights throughout the Village. 
 

  
ADJOURNMENT 

 
 
There being no further business to be addressed, Commissioner Nero moved, and Commissioner Maxham 
seconded to adjourn into closed session at 7:25 p.m. The motion carried.  
 

Respectfully submitted,  
 
 
 

Megan Roach 
Deputy Village Clerk 



R E S O L U T I O N  No.

      BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, 
that we dispense with the reading of the individual bills inasmuch as each department head has approved
and signed bills in the following aggregate amount for their respective departments.

Refunds and Allocations 7,661.76  
Public Affairs 152,410.02  
Police Department 2,921.43  
Community Center 1,256.84  
Accounts & Finance (Clerks Office) 589,448.87  
Accounts & Finance (Fire Department) 10,521.09  
Department of Health & Safety 5,211.05  
Streets and Public Improvements 150,409.81  
Public Property 129,469.05  
Seizure 3,243.85  
Police DUI 109.37  
Federal Customs 3,799.76  
TIF 20,862.00  
VIP 11,742.23  
Water Department 487,895.52  

TOTAL 1,576,962.65$ 

ADOPTED BY THE Council of the Village of Forest Park this 15th Day of December 2025

Ayes:
Nays:
Absent:

___________________________
Rory Hoskins, Mayor

ATTEST:

___________________________
Megan Roach, Deputy Clerk



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

100-00-000-4111-210  Forest Park Public Library 12/05/2025 7,219.68         
100-00-000-4230-135  Spower LLC 02/13/2025 300.00            
100-00-000-4450-121  Passport Labs Inc 11/30/2025 142.08            

Refunds and Allocations 7,661.76         



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

100-10-101-6100-100  Storino Ramello & Durkin 10/31/2025 3,569.30         
100-10-101-6100-100  Storino Ramello & Durkin 10/31/2025 1,323.00         
100-10-101-6100-100  Storino Ramello & Durkin 10/31/2025 237.30            
100-10-101-6100-305  InMotion Hosting 12/01/2025 136.63            
100-10-101-6120-160  Zoom Video Communications Inc 12/04/2025 94.99              
100-10-101-6120-300  Westgate Flower and Plant Shop 11/14/2025 100.00            
100-10-101-6120-305  Growing Community Media NFP 12/03/2025 245.00            
100-10-101-6150-112  Chicago Metropolitan Agency for Planning 11/19/2025 629.63            
100-10-101-6150-125  IPELRA 12/12/2025 100.00            
100-10-101-6150-125  IPELRA 12/12/2025 100.00            
100-10-101-6150-152  Verizon Wireless 11/22/2025 239.57            
100-10-101-6150-152  Verizon Wireless 11/22/2025 42.43              
100-10-101-6150-202  C.O.P.S. and F.I.R.E Personnel Testing 11/11/2025 500.00            
100-10-101-6150-222  American Legal Publishing 11/25/2025 337.00            
100-10-101-6150-300  West Suburban Cons Dispatch Center 12/02/2025 126,319.67     
100-11-111-6100-115  Lauterbach & Amen LLP 11/21/2025 800.00            
100-11-111-6100-115  Grant Writing Consultants LLC 12/01/2025 2,500.00         
100-11-111-6100-115  Aronson and Associates Ltd 11/06/2025 5,500.00         
100-11-111-6100-115  Aronson and Associates Ltd 11/10/2025 7,000.00         
100-11-111-6100-115  Lauterbach & Amen LLP 11/25/2025 350.00            
100-11-111-6100-115  Lauterbach & Amen LLP 11/25/2025 950.00            
100-11-111-6110-105  Proxit Technology Solutions Inc 11/12/2025 1,308.00         
100-11-111-6110-110  Springbrook Holding Company LLC 11/30/2025 27.50              

Public Affairs 152,410.02     



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

100-12-121-6120-305  Westgate Flower and Plant Shop 11/14/2025 112.98            
100-12-124-6150-114  Thomson Reuters-West 11/01/2025 578.41            
100-12-124-6150-114  Elineup LLC 11/17/2025 750.00            
100-12-126-6145-126  Verizon Wireless 11/22/2025 40.04              
100-12-126-6145-126  Total Parking Solutions Inc 12/01/2025 1,440.00         

Police Department 2,921.43         



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

100-15-152-6170-200  Amazon.com 12/05/2025 222.89            
100-15-154-6170-102  Case Lots Inc 10/27/2025 33.95              
100-15-154-6170-102 Murray Weiner 08/29/2025 1,000.00         

Community Center 1,256.84         



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

100-00-000-1201-001  Illinois Counties Risk Management Trust 12/01/2025 245,419.25     
100-00-000-1201-001  Illinois Counties Risk Management Trust 12/01/2025 131,811.75     
100-21-211-5005-002  Blue Cross-Blue Shield of Ill 11/14/2025 157,727.36     
100-21-211-5005-002  Fidelity Security Life Ins Co 11/22/2025 653.92            
100-21-211-5005-002  Fidelity Security Life Ins Co 11/22/2025 71.90              
100-21-211-5005-002  Guardian 11/19/2025 7,119.94         
100-21-211-6120-300  Elmhurst Occupational Health 10/31/2025 119.00            
100-21-211-6120-300  Elmhurst Occupational Health 10/31/2025 78.00              
100-21-211-6120-300  Resource Associates Inc 12/04/2025 55.00              
100-21-211-6140-104  Office 8 11/14/2025 342.93            
100-21-211-6140-104  Pitney Bowes Inc 11/05/2025 165.98            
100-21-211-6140-112  Rydin Decal 11/18/2025 686.05            
100-21-211-6140-112  Rydin Decal 11/18/2025 4,095.83         
100-21-211-6140-140  Quill 11/13/2025 150.97            
100-21-211-6140-140  Quill 11/25/2025 264.74            
100-21-211-6140-140  Quill 12/01/2025 41.89              
100-21-211-6150-112  Illinois Government Finance Officers Association 11/05/2025 225.00            
100-21-211-6150-112  Illinois Government Finance Officers Association 11/05/2025 100.00            
100-21-211-6150-150  AT&T 11/07/2025 230.28            
100-21-211-6150-150  AT&T 11/25/2025 63.67              
100-21-211-6150-150  AT&T 12/25/2025 127.34            
100-21-211-6190-003  POLICE PENSION FUND 12/05/2025 11,850.00       
100-21-211-6190-004  Firefighters Pension Fund 12/05/2025 11,850.00       
100-21-211-6191-001  POLICE PENSION FUND 12/05/2025 2,429.24         
100-21-211-6191-002  Firefighters Pension Fund 12/05/2025 2,645.41         
100-21-211-7000-080  GFC Leasing - WI 11/16/2025 1,709.16         
100-22-221-6310-410  Cook County Treasurer 12/15/2025 7,664.26         
100-22-221-6320-510  APPLIED CONCEPTS INC. 11/11/2025 1,750.00         

Accounts and Finance (Clerks Office) 589,448.87     



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

100-30-302-6110-150  Verizon Wireless 11/22/2025 138.18            
100-30-302-6110-200  Air One Equipment Inc 11/26/2025 927.00            
100-30-302-6145-100  Air One Equipment Inc 11/20/2025 40.00              
100-30-302-6145-105 Lou Davini 11/14/2025 100.00            
100-30-302-6145-105 Ray O'Herron Co Inc 09/29/2025 266.82            
100-30-302-6150-122  Village of Romeoville Fire Academy 11/06/2025 2,790.00         
100-30-302-6150-122  Village of Romeoville Fire Academy 11/20/2025 425.00            
100-30-302-6150-122  NIPSTA 09/10/2025 5,495.00         
100-30-303-6145-300  Henry Schein 11/07/2025 125.14            
100-30-303-6145-300  Henry Schein 11/13/2025 187.71            
100-30-303-6145-300  Zoll Medical Corp 11/05/2025 26.24              

Accounts and Finance (Fire Department) 10,521.09       



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

100-40-401-5000-017 Raymond Traynor 11/24/2025 900.00            
100-40-401-5000-017  AMS Electric Inc 12/03/2025 1,035.00         
100-40-401-5000-017 Tariq Dandan 12/01/2025 50.00              
100-40-402-6100-100  Storino Ramello & Durkin 10/31/2025 325.50            
100-40-402-6150-232 Tariq Dandan 12/01/2025 1,162.00         
100-40-403-6140-206  Smithereen Pest Mgmt Services 10/29/2025 300.00            
100-40-403-6140-206  Smithereen Pest Mgmt Services 12/01/2025 1,200.00         
100-40-403-6150-230  Elevator Inspection Services 11/18/2025 80.00              
100-40-410-6140-110  Forest Printing Company 11/19/2025 158.55            

Department of Health and Safety 5,211.05         



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

100-50-501-6145-100  Special T Unlimited 11/13/2025 99.00              
100-50-501-6145-100 Steve Brhel 12/04/2025 100.00            
100-50-502-6140-202  HOME DEPOT CREDIT 10/14/2025 43.97              
100-50-502-6185-102  Lakeshore Recycling Systems LLC 11/15/2025 4,982.36         
100-50-502-6185-102  Lakeshore Recycling Systems LLC 11/30/2025 9,048.08         
100-50-502-6185-106  Morton Salt Inc (MSI) 12/01/2025 4,315.40         
100-50-502-6185-106  Morton Salt Inc (MSI) 12/04/2025 3,775.81         
100-50-502-6185-110  Traffic Control & Protection 11/19/2025 240.00            
100-50-502-6185-110  Solar Traffic Systems 09/08/2025 2,065.52         
100-50-502-6185-110  Traffic Safety Products 12/03/2025 52.37              
100-50-502-6185-112  Republic Services #551 11/15/2025 2,595.84         
100-50-502-6185-501  Republic Services #551 11/15/2025 47,126.10       
100-50-502-6185-502  Republic Services #551 11/15/2025 33,314.23       
100-50-502-6185-503  Republic Services #551 11/15/2025 4,679.05         
100-50-502-6185-505  West Cook County Solid Waste 10/31/2025 20,605.75       
100-50-502-6185-505  West Cook County Solid Waste 11/30/2025 17,366.33       

Streets and Public Improvements 150,409.81     



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

100-55-552-6145-100 Jim Becker 11/18/2025 176.00            
100-55-552-6145-100 Jim Becker 11/19/2025 100.00            
100-55-552-6145-100  Special T Unlimited 11/13/2025 318.00            
100-55-553-6180-150  Lyons Pinner Electric Co 11/19/2025 6,661.00         
100-55-553-6180-150  Lyons Pinner Electric Co 11/19/2025 500.19            
100-55-553-6180-150  Lyons Pinner Electric Co 11/24/2025 511.00            
100-55-553-6180-150  Lyons Pinner Electric Co 11/24/2025 581.88            
100-55-553-6180-150  Lyons Pinner Electric Co 11/26/2025 114.45            
100-55-553-6180-150  Lyons Pinner Electric Co 11/30/2025 1,348.90         
100-55-553-6180-152  Lyons Pinner Electric Co 11/30/2025 595.00            
100-55-553-6180-160  Com Ed 11/21/2025 93.21              
100-55-553-6180-160  Com Ed 11/25/2025 4,615.26         
100-55-553-6180-160  Com Ed 12/01/2025 240.75            
100-55-553-6180-160  Com Ed 12/02/2025 340.58            
100-55-553-6180-160  Com Ed 12/03/2025 46.25              
100-55-560-6110-100  Total Parking Solutions Inc 12/01/2025 34,860.00       
100-55-560-6110-100  Total Parking Solutions Inc 12/01/2025 25,200.00       
100-55-570-6155-101  Mohr Oil Company 11/12/2025 12,583.21       
100-55-570-6155-101  Mohr Oil Company 11/22/2025 14,235.56       
100-55-570-6155-101  Superior Petroleum Marketers 11/25/2025 736.50            
100-55-570-6155-102  Factory Motor Parts Co 11/13/2025 43.74              
100-55-570-6155-102  Factory Motor Parts Co 11/13/2025 164.76            
100-55-570-6155-102  Factory Motor Parts Co 11/13/2025 87.48              
100-55-570-6155-102  Factory Motor Parts Co 11/13/2025 43.74              
100-55-570-6155-105 Joseph Decosola 11/07/2025 61.35              
100-55-570-6155-106  Currie Motors Chevrolet 05/02/2025 213.02            
100-55-570-6155-106  Currie Motors Chevrolet 10/31/2025 505.64            
100-55-570-6155-106  Currie Motors Chevrolet 11/06/2025 10.58              
100-55-570-6155-106  Currie Motors Chevrolet 11/11/2025 11.62              
100-55-570-6155-106  Currie Motors Chevrolet 11/13/2025 10.30              
100-55-570-6155-106  Fire Service Inc 09/19/2025 55.96              
100-55-570-6155-106  Fire Service Inc 09/22/2025 507.37            
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 11/03/2025 485.19            
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 11/05/2025 153.44            
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 11/05/2025 84.83              
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 11/07/2025 36.10              
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 11/12/2025 315.19            



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 11/12/2025 5.95                
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 11/12/2025 84.42              
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 11/14/2025 185.39            
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 11/21/2025 14.33              
100-55-570-6155-106  Kimball Midwest 11/18/2025 173.59            
100-55-570-6155-106  Linde Gas & Equipment, Inc. 11/15/2025 306.59            
100-55-570-6155-106  Linde Gas & Equipment, Inc. 11/19/2025 114.00            
100-55-570-6155-106  Linde Gas & Equipment, Inc. 11/22/2025 292.55            
100-55-570-6155-106  Linde Gas & Equipment, Inc. 11/22/2025 285.50            
100-55-570-6155-106  Service Spring 11/17/2025 142.72            
100-55-570-6155-106  Standard Equipment Co. 11/21/2025 257.34            
100-55-570-6155-106  Terminal Supply Co 11/07/2025 849.50            
100-55-570-6155-106  Zeigler Ford North Riverside 11/14/2025 1,200.59         
100-55-570-6155-106  Zeigler Ford North Riverside 11/14/2025 16.56              
100-55-570-6155-106  Zeigler Ford North Riverside 11/17/2025 8.00                
100-55-570-6155-106  Currie Motors Chevrolet 11/25/2025 139.80            
100-55-570-6155-106  Currie Motors Chevrolet 11/25/2025 278.36            
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 10/07/2025 711.57            
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 12/01/2025 199.00            
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 12/01/2025 71.76              
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 12/01/2025 83.88              
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 12/03/2025 229.44            
100-55-570-6155-106  Factory Motor Parts Co 12/04/2025 274.50            
100-55-570-6155-106  Kimball Midwest 12/01/2025 433.54            
100-55-570-6155-106  L.A.FASTENERS INC. 12/02/2025 37.55              
100-55-570-6155-106  Regional Truck Equipment Co 11/12/2025 973.70            
100-55-570-6155-106  Service Spring 11/25/2025 74.00              
100-55-570-6155-106  Zeigler Ford North Riverside 11/22/2025 195.89            
100-55-570-6155-106  Zeigler Ford North Riverside 11/25/2025 92.00              
100-55-570-6155-112  Action Transmission & Auto 11/19/2025 3,600.00         
100-55-570-6155-112  City of Berwyn 11/12/2025 609.63            
100-55-570-6155-112  Commercial Tire Service 11/14/2025 772.51            
100-55-570-6155-112  Commercial Tire Service 11/14/2025 691.47            
100-55-570-6155-112  Commercial Tire Service 11/20/2025 51.50              
100-55-570-6155-112  Kimball Midwest 11/17/2025 496.34            
100-55-570-6155-112  Action Transmission & Auto 12/04/2025 1,821.29         
100-55-570-6155-112  Commercial Tire Service 11/28/2025 461.16            



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

100-55-570-6155-112  Cummins Inc 09/12/2025 4,610.33         
100-55-570-6155-112  Cummins Inc 09/12/2025 138.31            
100-55-580-6155-120  Bernie's Saw & Supply Inc 11/20/2025 236.44            
100-55-580-6180-302  Davis Tree Care 11/21/2025 850.00            
100-55-580-6180-302  Davis Tree Care 11/26/2025 750.00            

Public Property 129,469.05     



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

230-00-000-6150-152  Verizon Wireless 11/22/2025 200.03            
230-00-000-6900-230 Andrew Brooks 11/17/2025 1,239.50         
230-00-000-6900-230  Currie Motors Chevrolet 10/30/2025 404.82            
230-00-000-6900-230  Currie Motors Chevrolet 10/31/2025 160.00            
230-00-000-6900-230  Illinois State Police 11/17/2025 1,239.50         

Seizure 3,243.85         



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

231-00-000-6900-231  APPLIED CONCEPTS INC. 11/11/2025 109.37            

Police DUII 109.37            



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

232-00-000-6900-231 George Hickey 11/13/2025 75.76              
232-00-000-6900-231  Illinois Alarm 12/01/2025 927.00            
232-00-000-6900-231  Uniforms Direct LLC 11/05/2025 297.00            
232-00-000-6900-231  Grant Writing Consultants LLC 12/01/2025 2,500.00         

Federal Customs 3,799.76         



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

304-00-000-6100-100  Storino Ramello & Durkin 10/31/2025 682.50            
304-00-000-6100-100  Storino Ramello & Durkin 10/31/2025 966.00            
304-00-000-6180-114  McAdam Landscaping 11/07/2025 908.00            
306-00-000-6180-114  McAdam Landscaping 11/07/2025 908.00            
306-00-000-6185-700  Total Parking Solutions Inc 12/01/2025 3,360.00         
306-00-000-6185-700  Total Parking Solutions Inc 12/01/2025 3,984.00         
309-00-000-6100-100  Storino Ramello & Durkin 10/31/2025 567.00            
309-00-000-6100-100  Storino Ramello & Durkin 10/31/2025 861.00            
309-00-000-6100-115  Ryan LLC 12/04/2025 7,717.50         
309-00-000-6180-114  McAdam Landscaping 11/07/2025 908.00            

TIF 20,862.00       



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

312-00-000-6100-100  Storino Ramello & Durkin 10/31/2025 2,117.50         
312-00-000-6150-152  Verizon Wireless 11/22/2025 74.02              
312-00-000-6180-114  HOME DEPOT CREDIT 10/23/2025 998.00            
312-00-000-6180-114  HOME DEPOT CREDIT 11/05/2025 145.52            
312-00-000-6180-114  McAdam Landscaping 11/07/2025 376.00            
312-00-000-6180-114  Case Lots Inc 11/20/2025 598.80            
312-00-000-6180-114  Kramer Tree Specialists Inc 12/01/2025 650.00            
312-00-000-6180-200  Comcast 11/08/2025 200.21            
312-00-000-6180-200  Quill 11/12/2025 122.38            
312-00-000-6180-200  Quill 11/13/2025 75.00              
312-00-000-6180-200  PremiStar-North 11/24/2025 537.00            
312-00-000-6180-200  Quill 12/01/2025 591.25            
312-00-000-6180-210  Comcast 11/02/2025 40.71              
312-00-000-6180-210  Comcast 11/12/2025 2.31                
312-00-000-6180-210  PremiStar-North 11/19/2025 943.77            
312-00-000-6180-215  PremiStar-North 11/22/2025 331.20            
312-00-000-6180-230  Case Lots Inc 10/27/2025 306.40            
312-00-000-6180-240  Comcast 11/07/2025 2.31                
312-00-000-6180-240  HOME DEPOT CREDIT 10/23/2025 47.37              
312-00-000-6180-240  Jack's Rental Inc. 11/12/2025 129.95            
312-00-000-6180-240  Jack's Rental Inc. 11/13/2025 129.95            
312-00-000-6180-240  Jack's Rental Inc. 11/13/2025 133.50            
312-00-000-6180-240  American Door and Dock 11/30/2025 842.25            
312-00-000-6180-240  Comcast 11/22/2025 275.72            
312-00-000-6180-240  Comcast 11/28/2025 2.31                
312-00-000-6180-240  Case Lots Inc 11/20/2025 79.80              
312-00-000-6180-250  Military & Police Supply 11/10/2025 272.00            
312-00-000-6180-250  Meade Electric Co 11/13/2025 1,026.00         
312-00-000-6180-250  Liberty Flag & Specialty 09/17/2025 531.00            
312-00-000-7000-312  K-Five Hodgkins LLC 11/13/2025 160.00            

VIP 11,742.23       



Account Number Vendor Invoice Date Amount

501-80-800-6100-100  Storino Ramello & Durkin 10/31/2025 3,260.30         
501-80-800-6110-105  Verizon Wireless 11/22/2025 36.01              
501-80-800-6110-105  Verizon Wireless 11/22/2025 36.01              
501-80-800-6110-105  Springbrook Holding Company LLC 11/30/2025 104.00            
501-80-800-6150-150  AT&T 11/25/2025 67.70              
501-80-800-6150-154  Com Ed 11/14/2025 142.99            
501-80-800-6150-154  Com Ed 11/17/2025 27.31              
501-80-800-6800-100  City of Chicago 12/10/2025 162,834.60     
501-80-800-6800-111  Suburban Laboratories Inc 12/02/2025 1,413.50         
501-80-800-6800-150  Centurion Plumbing Company 11/25/2025 6,601.66         
501-80-800-6800-150  Centurion Plumbing Company 11/25/2025 4,681.47         
501-80-800-6800-151  Core & Main LP 11/24/2025 2,364.00         
501-80-800-6800-151  Centurion Plumbing Company 11/25/2025 5,594.71         
501-80-800-6800-151  Centurion Plumbing Company 11/25/2025 5,936.92         
501-80-800-6800-151  Centurion Plumbing Company 11/25/2025 7,607.82         
501-80-800-6800-151  Centurion Plumbing Company 11/25/2025 4,681.46         
501-80-800-6800-153  Comcast 11/06/2025 95.35              
501-80-800-6800-153  PremiStar-North 11/22/2025 3,310.63         
501-80-800-6800-153  PremiStar-North 11/27/2025 4,785.64         
501-80-800-7000-001  Clear View Plumbing & Sewer Inc 11/21/2025 3,392.00         
501-80-800-7000-001  Core & Main LP 11/18/2025 1,096.00         
501-80-800-7000-001  Veregy Central LLC 10/31/2025 262,200.44     
501-80-800-7000-006 Christopher Burke Engineering LTD 07/24/2025 7,375.00         
501-80-800-7000-006  Growing Community Media NFP 11/14/2025 250.00            

Water Department 487,895.52     











Arts Alliance Forest 
Park 

BRIDGET LANE



Agenda

• What is the Arts Alliance 
• Our Board
• Impact
• 2025 Community Programs
• Social Media Reach 
• Summary



What is the Arts 
Alliance? 

3

• Our Mission is to bring artists and 
residents together to enrich our 
lives through the joy of art!

• Special artistic community 
organization that focuses on 
collaboration with other 
organizations 

• 501c3

•  Volunteer-based organization 



Our Board & Special Contributors

Karen 
Rozmus

Lin 
Beribak

Rick 
Wagner

Bridget 
Lane

Cecily 
Roland

Kevin 
Leonard Izzo

Terry 
Steinbac

h
Allison 

Holtman
Rachell Entler 

& Megan 
Roach

Public Works
Margie 

Wilkinso
n

4



Established Programs

• Garage Galleries
• Fiber Flash
• Sit & Savor
• Tellers Night 
• Makers Market
• Scarecrows (FPHS)
• Stoop Sessions
• 48 Hour Film Festival
• Trophies for Garden 
Walk and Casket Races

• Temporary Art 
Installations

5



2025 Community Turnout 

6

TELLERS NIGHT: 
495

STOOP 
SESSIONS: 300

GARAGE 
GALLERIES: 800+

SCARECROWS:  
105

FILM FESTIVAL: 
85



Social Media Reach

7

• Over 57k views during the last 60 days
• Up 70% from the previous 60 days
• Over 1k Interactions, up 316% from previous 

28 days
• 909 Reactions
• 189 Shares 
• 52 Comments 



“Art has the power to 
bring people together, to 

spark conversation, and to 
remind us of our shared 

humanity.”

8

-Unknown



Village Help

9

• Sponsor a volunteer recruitment event
• Keep supporting our 2026 Programs

• Garden Poles 
• Stoop Sessions
• Bistro Tables
• Garage Galleries
• Fiber Flash
• 7410 Madison Events 



How 
Volunteers 
Can Help

10

• Lend a hand at events — or help dream 
up new ones!
Whether you love greeting guests, 
organizing behind the scenes, or 
brainstorming fresh ideas, volunteers play a 
huge role in bringing creative events to life.
• Help us build stronger connections across 
Forest Park.
Join us as we partner with schools, 
nonprofits, neighborhood groups, and 
community organizations to grow the arts 
in meaningful, collaborative ways.
• Support smoother, smarter event 
planning.
If you enjoy structure, logistics, or process 
improvement, we’d love your help 
streamlining how we plan and run events 
so we can make an even bigger impact.
• Collaborate with local businesses to bring 
more art to Forest Park.
Work with shops, restaurants, and 
community spaces to create artistic 
installations, displays, and experiences that 
brighten our town and support local 
makers.



Summary

The Arts Alliance Forest Park celebrates the 
creativity that makes our community shine. 
Through events that bring neighbors together, we 
turn everyday spaces into places of inspiration, 
expression, and connection.

Our events weave art into the fabric of Forest 
Park, reminding us that community isn’t just 
where we live — it’s what we create together.

11



Thank you

https://forestparkarts.org/







 Amount 
Appropriated  Amount Levied  

OFFICE OF PUBLIC AFFAIRS
General Public Affairs
Salary for the Honorable Mayor 30,000$            30,000$                   
Salary for the Liquor Commissioner 10,000$            10,000$                   
Salary for Village Prosecutor 41,540$            
Salaries for Support Staff 204,278$          80,000$                   
Commissions 68,565$            
Codification of Village Code 9,000$              
Legal Services/Labor Negotiations 270,670$          
Consolidated Dispatch Service 1,079,018$       
Consulting Services 187,869$          
IT Village-wide 167,083$          
Community Relations / Office Expenses 150,217$          
     Total for General Public Affairs 2,218,240$       120,000$                 

Police Department
Management and Office Salaries 1,908,696$       370,000$                 
Law Enforcement Expenses 301,033$          
Officer Salaries 4,981,625$       295,000$                 
     Total Police Department 7,191,354$       665,000$                 

Section II: The total amount of appropriations for all corporate purposes legally made to be collected from the tax levy of 
the current year is hereby ascertained to be the sum of ten million, two hundred thirty thousand, and one hundred eighteen 
00/100 Dollars ($10,230,118.00) for the fiscal year beginning May 1, 2025 and ending April 30, 2026.

Section III: The sum of ten million, two hundred thirty thousand, and one hundred eighteen 00/100 Dollars 
($10,230,118.00), being the total of appropriations heretofore legally made which are to be collected from the tax levy of 
the current fiscal year of the Village of Forest Park for all corporate purposes of said Village, be and the same is hereby 
levied upon all of the taxable property in the Village of Forest Park subject to taxation for the current year, the specific 
amounts as levied for the various funds being included herein by being placed in separate columns under the heading 
"Amount Levied," which appears over the same, the tax so levied being for the current fiscal year of said Village, and the 
purpose for which appropriations are made and the amount appropriated for each purpose, respectively, to be collected from 
the tax levy is as follows:

GENERAL FUND

Section I: This Ordinance is hereby termed "the Annual Tax Levy Ordinance of the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, 
Illinois, for the fiscal year beginning May 1, 2025 and ending April 30, 2026."

ORDINANCE NO.  O-     -25
THE ANNUAL TAX LEVY ORDINANCE OF THE VILLAGE OF FOREST PARK
COOK COUNTY, ILLINOIS FOR THE FISCAL YEAR BEGINNING MAY 1, 2025

AND ENDING APRIL 30, 2026

Be it ordained by the Council of the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois:



 Amount 
Appropriated  Amount Levied  

Community Center
Salaries 537,772$          75,000$                   
Community Relations / Office Expenses 13,513$            
Day Care Costs 40,560$            
Events / Senior Services 100,100$          
RTA Salaries 98,582$            
RTA Office / Equipment Expense 1,250$              
     Total Community Center 791,777$          75,000$                   

TOTAL FOR OFFICE OF PUBLIC AFFAIRS 10,201,371$     860,000$                 

OFFICE OF ACCOUNTS AND FINANCE
Accounts and Finance
Commissioner of Accounts and Finance 10,000$            10,000$                   
Salaries 286,078$          75,000$                   
Village Clerk / HR Administrator 81,868$            
Insurance Benefits 2,928,066$       
Audit/Consulting Services 28,326$            
Office Equipment and Supplies 483,176$          
Police Pension Cost 3,049,439$       2,800,000$              
Fire Pension Cost 2,646,480$       2,200,000$              
Federal Grants 1,261,862$       
State Grants 227,125$          
Local Grants 110,589$          
Liability Insurance 1,204,668$       100,000$                 
     Total Clerk's Office 12,317,677$     5,185,000$              

Fire Department
Management and Office Salaries 983,863$          211,553$                 
Firefighter Salaries 2,908,982$       295,000$                 
Firefighting Equipment / Expenses 673,234$          
Community Relations / Office Expenses 18,055$            
Paramedic Services 1,302,767$       
     Total Fire Department 5,886,901$       506,553$                 

TOTAL FOR OFFICE OF ACCOUNTS AND FINANCE 18,204,578$     5,691,553$              



 Amount 
Appropriated  Amount Levied  

OFFICE OF HEALTH AND SAFETY
Commissioner 10,000$            10,000$                   
Salaries 318,824$          70,000$                   
Plan Review / Inspections 213,000$          
Community Relations / Office Expenses 24,600$            

TOTAL OFFICE OF HEALTH AND SAFETY 566,424$          80,000$                   

OFFICE OF STREETS AND PUBLIC IMPROVEMENTS
Commissioner 10,000$            
Salaries 436,728$          170,000$                 
Community Relations / Office Expenses 15,750$            
Street Maintenance, Equipment, and Supplies 1,716,645$       

TOTAL OFFICE OF STREETS AND PUBLIC IMPROVEMENTS 2,179,123$       170,000$                 

OFFICE OF PUBLIC PROPERTY
Commissioner 10,000$            10,000$                   
Salaries 557,706$          160,000$                 
Community Relations / Office Expenses 11,460$            
Property Maintenance 116,204$          
     Total General Public Property 695,370$          170,000$                 

Street and Traffic Lighting 280,000$          -$                            

Fleet Maintenance 726,375$          -$                            

Forestry
Salaries 247,110$          50,000$                   
Other Forestry Expenses 161,927$          
     Total Forestry 409,037$          50,000$                   

Playgrounds and Recreation
Playground Maintenance / Improvement 11,250$            -$                            
Dog Park 12,000$            -$                            
     Total for Playgrounds and Recreation 23,250$            -$                            

TOTAL OFFICE OF PUBLIC PROPERTY 2,134,032$       220,000$                 

TOTAL GENERAL FUND 33,285,528$     7,021,553$              



 Amount 
Appropriated  Amount Levied  

OFFICE OF ACCOUNTS AND FINANCE
IMRF Fund 171,549$          110,000$                 

Social Security Fund 410,279$          365,000$                 

TOTAL SPECIAL REVENUE FUNDS OFFICE OF ACCOUNTS AND 
FINANCE 581,828$          475,000$                 

TOTAL VILLAGE FUNDS CAPPED 33,867,356$     7,496,553$              

FIRE PENSION PA 93-0689 CONTRIBUTION EXEMPT FROM PTELL -$                      216,097$                 

TOTAL VILLAGE OF FOREST PARK FUNDS 33,867,356$     7,712,650$              

Corporate
Salaries 1,350,000$       1,350,000$              
Office Expenses / Equipment 900,000$          707,300$                 
Circulation Collection 250,000$          220,000$                 

Capital Expenditures 300,000$          -$                            

Special Tax Expenses
Building and Grounds Maintenance 80,000$            76,168$                   
Unemployment Insurance 5,000$              5,000$                     
Workmen's Compensation 5,000$              5,000$                     
FICA 100,000$          75,000$                   
Liability Insurance 25,000$            20,000$                   
IMRF 75,000$            50,000$                   
Audit 10,500$            9,000$                     

TOTAL FREE PUBLIC LIBRARY FUND 3,100,500$       2,517,468$              

TOTAL AMOUNT APPROPRIATED / LEVIED 36,967,856$     10,230,118$            

SPECIAL REVENUE FUNDS

FREE PUBLIC LIBRARY



 Amount 
Appropriated  Amount Levied  

AYES:  _______________
NAYS:  _____________
ABSENT:  ______________ Approved:

____________________________
Mayor

Attest:

____________________________
Deputy Village Clerk

ADOPTED by the Council of the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, this 15th day of December, 2025.

Section IV:  The total amount of ten million, two hundred thirty thousand,  and one hundred eighteen 00/100 Dollars 
($10,230,118.00) ascertained above, be and is hereby levied and assessed on all property subject to taxation within the 
Village of Forest Park according to the value of said property as assessed and equalized for state, county, and municipal 
purposes for the current year.

Section V:  This Ordinance is adopted pursuant to the procedures set forth in the Illinois Municipal Code.

Section VI: There is hereby certified to the County Clerk of Cook County, Illinois, the several sums above, constituting 
said total amount of ten million, two hundred thirty thousand, and one hundred eighteen 00/100 Dollars ($10,230,118.00), 
which said total amount the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, requires to be raised by taxation for the current 
fiscal year of said Village, and the Village Clerk of said Village is hereby ordered and directed to file with the County Clerk 
of Cook County, Illinois, on or before the time required by law, a certified copy of this Ordinance.

Section VII:  If any item, purpose, sentence or portion thereof of this Ordinance be, for any reason, held invalid or 
unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance, and any ordinance 
or parts of any ordinance in conflict herewith are repealed.

Section VIII:  This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and approval.



RESOLUTION NO. R-_________-25 

 

 

A RESOLUTION DIRECTING THE COUNTY CLERK TO CALCULATE  

SEPARATE LIMITING RATES FOR THE TAX LEVY OF THE VILLAGE OF  

FOREST PARK, ILLINOIS FOR THE 2025 TAX LEVY YEAR 

 

 WHEREAS, pursuant to section 18-195 of the Property Tax Extension Limitation Law, 

(35 ILCS 200/18-185 et seq.) the corporate authorities of a municipality may request the county 

clerk to calculate separate limiting rates for the library funds and the aggregate of the other village 

funds. 

 WHEREAS, the corporate authorities of the Village of Forest Park have determined that 

it is in the best interest of the Village to request the Cook County Clerk to calculate separate 

limiting rates for purposes of the Property Tax Extension Limitation Law. 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Village Council of the Village of 

Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, as follows: 

 Section 1. Direction to the County Clerk to Calculate Separate Limiting Rates.  

 The corporate authorities of the Village of Forest Park, Illinois, do hereby request and 

direct the Cook County Clerk to calculate separate limiting rates for the library funds and the 

aggregate of the other Village funds for the purposes of the Property Tax Extension Limitation 

Law, (35 ILCS 200/18-185 et seq.) for the Village of Forest Park 2025 tax levy. 

 Section 2. Direction to File Resolution with County Clerk.  

 The Village Clerk, or her designee, be and is hereby authorized and directed to cause a 

certified copy of this Resolution to be filed with the Tax Extension Division of the Cook County 

Clerk’s Office. 

  

 



Section 3. Effective Date. 

 This Resolution shall take effect upon its passage, as provided by law. 

 

Resolved this 15th day of December 2025. 

 

AYES: ___________________________________ 

 

NAYS: ___________________________________ 

 

ABSENT: _________________________________ 

 

      APPROVED: 

 

 

 

      _______________________________________ 

      Rory E. Hoskins, Mayor 

 

 

ATTESTED: 

 

 

 

______________________________________ 

Megan Roach, Deputy Village Clerk 

 

 

 

 
 



Date: 15 December 2025 

To: Mayor Hoskins and member of the Village Council 

From: Steve Glinke, Director DPHS 

Below are some of the changes associated with the building code update from version 
2009 to 2024.  Most of the code changes reflect new technologies as well as updated 
regulatory compliance requirements. 

From 2009 to 2024, significant changes in the International Code Council (ICC) codes 
have focused on enhanced fire and life safety, the integration of new 
technologies (like mass timber and energy storage systems), increased energy 
efficiency, and substantial formatting updates to improve user experience.  

Key changes across the IBC, IRC, IPC, and IMC include: 

Cross-Code (IBC/IRC/IPC/IMC) Formatting Changes 
• Digital Transformation: The 2024 codes feature major formatting changes to align 

print and digital versions, including a switch to single-column text and modernized fonts 
for better readability. 

• QR Codes: QR codes now replace traditional vertical margin markings to identify 
technical code changes, linking directly to digital explanations. 

• Content Grouping: Associated tables and figures are now grouped immediately after 
their parent section for ease of use.  

International Building Code (IBC) 
• Mass Timber Construction: New provisions and types (Type IV-A, IV-B, IV-C) have 

been added, allowing mass timber buildings up to 18 stories, with specific fire-
resistance and concealed space requirements. 

• Fire & Life Safety: Stricter criteria for smoke control systems, fire door assemblies, and 
egress in high-occupancy spaces have been introduced. Specific occupancies, like 
facilities manufacturing lithium-ion batteries, now require automatic sprinkler systems. 

• Occupant Safety: Requirements for secondary attachments to structural members for 
fire protection have been added, along with provisions for considering adjacent-lot 
buildings as a single fire/smoke unit. 



• Accessibility: Updates to accessibility standards (ANSI A117.1) mandate larger clear 
floor spaces for accessible units and enhanced guidance for controls and signage.  

International Residential Code (IRC) 
• Fire Separation: Provisions for "imaginary lot lines" are added to calculate fire 

separation distance for multiple dwellings on a single lot. 

• Energy Storage Systems: Extensive new requirements for energy storage systems 
and mandatory battery protection measures in garages have been introduced. 

• Loft Requirements: Specific requirements and maximum size limits have been added 
for sleeping lofts in habitable attics and tiny homes. 

• Structural & Safety: New prescriptive options for floor framing supporting guards are 
included, ensuring they can resist specific lateral loads.  

International Plumbing Code (IPC) 
• Water Efficiency: Showerhead flow rates have been reduced to a maximum of 2.0 

gallons per minute (GPM) to align with high-efficiency standards. 

• Piping Systems: New tracer wire requirements for buried plastic sewer piping and 
options for vacuum testing drain-waste-vent (DWV) systems are included. 

• Material Standards: Updated installation standards for solvent-cemented plastic piping 
joints and new standards for chemical waste piping materials have been added.  

International Mechanical Code (IMC) 
• Refrigerants: A2L and B2L refrigerants have been added as options for cooling 

equipment, with specific requirements for machinery rooms containing them. 

• Ventilation: Expanded ventilation rate tables for various occupancy classifications and 
new requirements for common exhaust ducts in dwelling units are present. 

• Combustion Air: Specific combustion air requirements from previous editions were 
replaced with references to NFPA 31 and manufacturer's instructions for oil and solid 
fuel-burning appliances.  

 

 



1 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
This report provides the significant changes to the 2018 – 2024 ICC Codes. The code 
changes on a three-year cycle and are dynamic in nature. They are regularly updated to 
reflect new technology, reflect changes in the construction industry, and responsive to 
disasters both natural and manmade. 
 
The definitions are continually being updated to reflect new products and changes in 
construction technology. It is typical that when there are changes in definitions, there are 
code changes based on the revised definitions. All the definitions except concrete are 
located in Chapter 2. 
 
In many cases the code changes are not wholesale in nature but rather clarifications for 
the application of the code. 
 
The changes to the referenced standards typically change the reference to the most 
current edition of the standard available when the code was published. 
 
The changes listed could have changes over any of the editions and were more than likely 
changed or modified over several editions. The changes are not listed in order of 
importance or by the year of the change. 
 
All the ICC codes have appendices which have been added or modified over rhe different 
editions. The appendices have to be formally adopted in order to be enforced 
 
There was a major change in the format of the ICC codes. It is not a technical change but 
a style change. The two column format was changed to a single column. There were 
changes to the marginal marking to highlight the changes. The code books have QR 
symbols that have to be scaned to view the changes and the rationale for the changes. 
 
Section 104.2 of each code clarifies the building official has the ability to determine code 
compliance, render interpretations and create policies.   
 
International Residential Code This code is used for the requirements for one and two 
family dwellings and townhouses. The code has Chapters for building, mechanical, 
energy, electrical and plumbing systems. The plumbing and energy changes are not 
typically used because the State of Illinois has its own plumbing and energy codes. 
 
1. A section which provides the requirements when intermodal shipping containers 

are used for buildings was added. 
 
2. Through an exception, the story height can be13 feet 7 inches when the clear story 

height does not exceed 12 feet. 

OFFICE & SHIPPING: 
2420 Vantage Drive 
CORRESPONDENCE: 
P.O. BOX 5178 
ELGIN, IL  60121-5178 

CONSTRUCTION CODE SERVICES, INC. 
BUILDING & FIRE PROTECTION PLAN REVIEW 
TRAINING • INSPECTIONS • CODE CONSULTING 

 

F B 
® 

& 

PHONE 
FAX 
TOLL FREE 
E-MAIL 

(847) 428-7010 
(847) 428-3151 
1-800-232-5523 

    bfccs@bfccs.org 



Code Update Study 
December 2025 
 

2 
 

 
3.  The door from the house to the garage will be self-latching, previous editions 

require the door to be self-closing. 
  
4.  Safety glazing is required around tub, shower and spa enclosures. The code 

changes clarify the distance from water edge when the safety glazing is required. 
 
5. The dimensions for emergency escape opening with area wells have been 
clarified. 
 
6. Storm shelters are not required. When they are constructed they shall comply with 

this code and ICC 500. 
 
7.  Exterior decks shall be designed to meet the structure floor loading or snow load 

requirement, whichever is stricter. 
 
8. The requirements for the construction of exterior decks continue to be 

strengthened. These change have been updated over a series of code editions 
 
9.  The code has required water resistive barrier behind exterior wall finishes. This 

code clarifies the type of material which can be used and requires flashing to 
maintain the water resistance. 

 
10.  Insulation which is installed in floor-ceiling assemblies, roof-ceiling assemblies, 

crawl spaces and attics shall have a maximum flame spread rating of 25. 
 
11. The requirements for stationary battery storage systems have been added to the 

code 
 
12. The requirements for the installation of solar panels on the roof including 

structural and location of pathways have been expanded and clarifies. 
 
13.  There are additional requirements for energy storage systems (ESS) including 

impact protection. 
 
14. The spans in the table for headers and girders sizing have been modified.  
 
16 A section for sleeping lofts was added. 
 
International Building Code This code is used for the requirements for industrial, 
commercial, institutional, education, business and apartment buildings. It has the 
building related criteria only. The requirements for other systems are in other codes. 
 
1. Dedicated buildings for energy storage systems are classified as a moderate 

hazard factory (group F-1). 
 



Code Update Study 
December 2025 
 

3 
 

2. There were some adjustments to the means of egress and enclosure requirements 
for atriums. 
 

3. Puzzle rooms and the means of egress for these rooms used for entertainment 
were added. 
 

4. Three new construction sub types for type 4 construction (heavy timber) were 
added. This corresponds to the rating requirements in Table 601. 
 

5. The method used to calculate street frontage increase when determining the size 
of a building were changed significantly. 
 

6. Table 508.4 which determines the separation requirements between uses was 
revised for ease of use. 
 

7. Rooms used for energy storage based systems were added to the incidental use 
Table, which regulates separation criteria. 
 

8. The design criteria for private garages, public garages and carports were clarified. 
 

9. The requirements for domestic cooking appliances in assisted care facilities was 
expanded. 
 

10. Two new technical sub sections were added 427 - Medical gas systems and 428 - 
Higher Education laboratories. 
 

11. Additional requirements for fire pump and sprinkler riser rooms were added. 
 

12. Table 602 (Rating of exterior walls) was renumbered to 707.5 and relocated to 
chapter 7. 
 

13. The requirement for fire dampers in elevator shaft walls which extend above the 
roof was removed.  
 

14. Buildings used for the bulk storage of distilled spirits shall be sprinklered. 
 

15. There are numerous minor changes to Chapter 10 – Means of Egress. 
 

16. Chapter 11 for Accessibility continues to be deleted because of the Illinois 
Accessibility Code. 
 

17. The occupancy exemptions based on high hazard occupancies were modified 
 

18. When storm shelters are required, shall comply with this code and ICC 500. 
 
International Mechanical Code This code is used for the requirements for the installation 
of mechanical equipment with solid or liquid fuels. It has the criteria for ductwork 



Code Update Study 
December 2025 
 

4 
 

systems, exhaust systems, boilers, cooking operations, refrigeration, and most 
mechanical systems. 
 
1. The Energy Code air leakage requirements are coordinated with section 403 for 

ventilation air. 
 
2. The general requirements for machine rooms exiting have been expanded and 

clarified. 
 

3. There is an added section for refrigeration machine room piping. 
 

4. The design requirements for roof top mounted solar thermal systems was 
expanded. 

 
International Fuel Gas Code This code is used for the requirements for the installation of 
gas supplied equipment, combustion air and gas piping systems. The criteria for duct 
work and ventilation air are in the mechanical code. The proper size and length if 
chimneys and vents for the gas appliances is in this code. 
 

1. The installation of threaded gas pipe shall use a non hardening sealing material. 
 

2. The code provides a design standard for residential motor vehicle fueling 
equipment with a maximum flow rate. 
 

3. The code provides a table and drawing for vent system terminal clearances. 
 
 

 International Fire Code This code is used for the requirements for basic fire prevention 
and the installation of hazardous materials and related systems. It has a specific chapter, 
which is applied for inspections for existing buildings and new installations. The 
maintenance requirements for all fire protection systems and the correct NFPA systems 
is in the fire code. 

 
1. The design criteria for emergency responder radio coverage continue to be 

expanded and clarified. 
 
2. The requirements for outdoor and indoor oil storage tanks was enhanced with 

design requirements and standards for tanks. 
 

3. Maintenance requirements for clothes dryer exhaust systems were added. 
 
4. When play structures exceeding 10 feet are added to and existing building, they 

shall comply with the building code. 
 
5. The fire code has the same numerous change to Chapter 10 – Means of egress as 

the building Code. 
 



Code Update Study 
December 2025 
 

5 
 

6. There are major changes and additions to Chapter 12 – Energy Systems. 
 
7. Chapter 39 – Processing and Extraction facilities and Chapter 38 – Higher 

Education Laboratories were added to the code. 
 
8. The requirements for additive manufacturing (3D printing were added to the code. 
 
9. The definition of life safety systems was added with Chapter 9 to reflect changes to 

fire protection system. 
 

    
International Existing Building Code This code provides the different compliance 
methods for existing buildings. It allows the design professional to choose the method 
used. It allows the reuse of existing buildings without having to totally comply with the 
new code. 
 
1 Repairs as a compliance path method were removed. 

 
2 The remaining compliance paths are prescriptive, work area or performance path 

methods.  
 

3.       When an alteration, addition or a change of occupancy is made to an existing 
building to groups R or I-1, smoke alarms and carbon monoxide detectors are 
required. 
 

4. When repairs to existing bleachers, grandstands and folding seating are done ICC 
standard 300 shall be followed. 
. 
. 

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code This code provides the requirements for 
installation of swimming pools and spas. It covers single family home, apartment 
building, hotel and motel pools and any other public pool. 
 
Many of the requirements in this code were in the appendices to previous codes with 
very few changes. 
 
State Mandated Codes These codes must be enforced because they are state codes. 
 
Illinois Plumbing Code – current edition 2014 
 

The municipality can modify this code but each amendment has to be approved by 
the Department of Public Health. The amendments cannot be less strict than the 
state code. 

 
Illinois Accessibility Code – current edition 2018 
 



Code Update Study 
December 2025 
 

6 
 

This is the State of Illinois updated Code. The changes were consistent with the 
ADA in 2018. 
The enforcement of this code is mandatory by the municipality. It can be modified 
but not be less strict. 

 
Illinois Energy Conservation Act adopts the current International Energy Conservation 
Code. 

 
The code has to be enforced including all State amendments. There can be no 
local amendments which are less strict. The State has recently adopted the 2024 
International Energy Conservation Code. 



1344038.1 
1 

ORDINANCE NO. O-______-25 
 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 8-1-1, ENTITLED “BUILDING  
CODES ADOPTION,” OF CHAPTER 1, ENTITLED “BUILDING CODES AND 

REGULATIONS,” OF TITLE 8, ENTITLED “BUILDING REGULATIONS,”  
OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE VILLAGE OF FOREST PARK 

 
WHEREAS, the Village of Forest Park (the “Village”) has not updated its Building Code 

in approximately sixteen (16) years; and 

WHEREAS, it is necessary and desirable that the Village update its Building Code to 

reflect the use of new materials, new technologies, and new practices; and 

WHEREAS, the Village deems it necessary and desirable to amend Section 8-1-1, entitled 

“Building Codes Adoption,” of Chapter 1, entitled “Building Codes and Regulations,” of Title 8, 

entitled “Building Regulations,” of the Municipal Code of the Village of Forest Park. 

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, 

as follows: 

Section 1.  The statements contained in the preambles to this Ordinance are found to 

be true and correct and are hereby adopted as part of this Ordinance. 

Section 2. Section 8-1-1, entitled “Building Codes Adoption,” of Chapter 1, entitled 

“Building Codes and Regulations,” of Title 8, entitled “Building Regulations,” of the Code of the 

Village of Forest Park (“Code”) is hereby amended as follows: 

8-1-1: BUILDING CODES ADOPTED: 

   A.   International Building Code: 

      1.   Code Adopted; Amendments: The Iinternational Bbuilding Ccode, 20202409 edition, as 
published in February 2009 by the International Code Council, Inc., is adopted as the Bbuilding 
Ccode of the Vvillage of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, for the control of properties, 
buildings and structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, 
penalties, conditions and terms of the Ininternational Bbuilding Ccode, 20092024 edition, are 
referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this subsection, with the 
additions, insertions, deletions and changes as follows: 

Section 101.1 Title (page  201), insert in blank "the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section 101.4.1 Gas (page 201), delete "Iinternational Ffuel gGaass Ccode" and insert "fuel gas 
code as adopted by the Vvillage of Forest Park". 



1344038.1 
2 

Section 101.4.2 Mechanical (page 201), delete "Iinternational Mmechanical Ccode" and insert 
"mechanical code as adopted by the village of Forest Park". 

Section 101.4.3 Plumbing (page 1), delete "Iinternational Pplumbing Ccode" and insert 
"plumbing code as adopted by the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section 101.4.4 Property Maintenance Code (page 201), delete "Iinternational Pproperty 
Mmaintenance Ccode" and insert "property maintenance code as adopted by the Vvillage of 
Forest Park". 

Section 101.4.5 Fire Prevention (page 201), delete "Iinternational Ffire Ccode" and insert "fire 
code as adopted by the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section 102.2 Other Laws, add the following: 

When there are conflicts between this code and any other code or standard adopted or 
referenced by this code or other Vviillage of Forest Park codes, the stricter of the requirements 
shall apply. 

Section 102.6 Existing Structures (page 2), replace "Iinternational Pproperty Mmaintenance 
code and Iinternational Ffire Ccode with property maintenance code and fire code adopted by 
the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section 103 (page 211-4), delete "department building safety" and insert "department of public 
health and safety". 

Section 103.1 Creation Of Enforcement Agency (page 211-4) shall read: 

"The department of public health and safety shall be responsible for the inspection and 
enforcement of this code. The director public health and safety shall be known as the building 
official." 

Section 103.2 Appointments (page 211), delete, "The code official shall be appointed by the 
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction" and insert "The code official shall be hired in 
accordance with the standard procedures of the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section 103.3 Deputies (page 211-5), amend the last sentence to readadd the following to the 
last sentence: 

"For the maintenance of existing properties, see the property maintenance code". 

Section 107.2.2 Plan SubmittalsConstruction documents, insert the following: 

The construction plans shall provide adequate information and details to show compliance with 
the code. The plans shall: 

      1.   Be on suitable material. 

      2.   Be on a scale which is legible. 



1344038.1 
3 

      3.   Show all dimensions, heights, room sizes. 

      4.   Show the location of all building equipment. 

      5.   Include a floor plan for all floors levels or stories. 

      6.   Include a reflected ceiling plan and roof plan. 

      7.   Include a wall, door, window and a finish schedule. 

      8.   Include all design loads. 

      9.   Include all appropriate details. 

      10.   Include all details showing energy conservation. 

      11.   Include a description of the use of all areas. 

      12.   Include all appropriate elevations. 

      13.   Include all calculations. 

      14.   Include information on the building mechanical, plumbing, electric and fire    protection 
and suppression systems. 

      15.   Include details for all stairs, guard rails and hand rails. 

      16.   Include details showing all details and dimensions showing accessibility. 

      17.   Include details and information showing compliance with all Forest Park codes, 
ordinances and amendments. 

      18.   The final approved plan shall be submitted as a PDF file or there will be an additional 
fee to create this file, see the fee schedule for the fee. 

Section 108.2114.4 Violation Penalties, add the following sentence: 

All penalties shall be as established by the village of Forest Park fee schedule. 

Section 108.3112.2 Temporary connection Power (page 286), delete "ICC electrical code" and 
insert "electrical code as adopted by the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section 109.2 Fees (page 276), add the following sentence: 

All fees shall be as established by the Vvillage of Forest Park fee schedule. 

Section 111.5 Partial Occupancy (page 298) shall be inserted and read as follows: 

"The building official is authorized to issue a partial occupancy for the installation of machines, 
equipment, furniture or other items required before the commencement of business. The 
portion of the building or structure that is to be occupied must meet all health and safety 
standards and requirements." 



1344038.1 
4 

Section 113 (page 308), delete entire section and insert: 

"In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the 
building official relative to the application and interpretation of this code, the commissioner of 
public health and safety shall be the governing authority. The commissioner of public health 
and safety shall adopt rules or procedures for conducting business". 

All requests for appeals shall be submitted to the building official within thirty (30) days of the 
plan review or inspection. All appeals shall be submitted in writing with an explanation of the 
basis for the appeal. 

The Bbuilding Oofficial shall review the appeal to determine the validity and correct application 
of the related code requirements. After the building official has determined the validity of the 
appeal, it shall be forwarded to the International Code Council for an interpretation of the code 
section. 

The interpretation of the International Code Council shall be used as the basis for the final 
decision of the appeal. 

Any appeals of the application of any local amendments to the adopted codes shall be made by 
the building official. 

The person or entity requesting the appeal has the ability to appeal the decision of the building 
official to the entire village board. 

Section 406.3.2406.1.4 Separation (page 944-29) shall be amended to read as follows: 

"1. The private garage shall be separated from the dwelling unit and its attic by means of a 
minimum 5/8 inch type 'X" gypsum board applied to the garage side. Garages beneath 
habitable rooms shall be separated from all habitable rooms above by walls and a floor ceiling 
assembly including beams and columns not less than 5/8 inch type 'X" gypsum board or 
equivalent. Door openings between the garage and residence shall be equipped with solid 
wood doors not less than 13/8 inches in thickness, solid or honeycomb core steel doors not less 
than 13/8 inches thick, or 20 minute fire-rated doors. Doors shall be equipped with an U.L. 
approved self closer. There shall be a six inch high curbing provided at the common walls 
between the garage and the habitable space, or the garage floor shall be constructed not less 
than six inches below the adjoining floor. Opening from a garage directly into a room used for 
sleeping purposes shall not be permitted." 

Section 502.1.1501.2.1, add the following: 

Tenant Identification: "All buildings with multiple tenants or units shall have signs in the 
corridor across from the elevator door. This direction signage shall indicate the direction to 
each number tenant space. All tenant spaces shall have a sign, which indicates the tenant space 
number. The signs shall be constructed of durable materials, be permanently installed and be 
readily visible. Letters and numbers shall contrast with the background and shall be a minimum 
of 2 inches in height". 



1344038.1 
5 

Section 504503 and table 503504.3, 504 and table 504.4, 506 and table 506.2 delete type IIIA, 
IIIB, IV, (IVA, IVB, IVC, HT), VA and VB construction types. 

Sections 602.3 (Type III Construction), 602.4 (Type IV Construction) and 602.5 (Type V 
Construction), delete these section in their entirety. These types of construction are not 
allowed. 

Delete sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.101 and insert: 

All new buildings of any group shall require an automatic sprinkler system. 

Exception: Detached structures, which comply with all of the following, do not require 
automatic fire sprinklers: 

      1.   Less than five hundred (500) square feet in area. 

      2.   Single story. 

      3.   Not used as a dwelling or sleeping unit. 

      4.   Not an high hazard group. 

      5.   Not used for high hazard products or hazardous materials. 

      6.   No basements. 

      7.   Minimum separation to other buildings 20 feet. 

When a building has a change of use or is renovated and all of the following conditions occurs, 
it shall have a complete automatic sprinkler system. 

      1.   The wall and ceiling finish for more than 75% of the walls and ceilings is removed. 

      2.   New walls are constructed which equal more than 75% of the existing wall and ceiling 
surface. The square footage of both sides is used when both sides of the wall are exposed to 
the building interior. 

      3.   The building renovation exceeds 75% of the replacement cost of the building. The Dodge 
report or the Means report are used to establish construction and replacement costs. 

      4.   The building or space has a total of more than 2,500 square feet. 

Add new section: 

Section 903.3.7903.6 Outside Sprinkler Alarm Devices. The outside alarm device for fire 
sprinkler systems shall be a horn strobe in a location approved by the fire department. 

Add new section: 



1344038.1 
6 

Section 903.3.8903.7 Floor Plans. When any building has multiple risers on any floor a floor 
layout for the sprinkler system showing all sprinkler zones shall be provided at the main 
sprinkler riser. 

Add new section: 

Section 903.3.9903.8 Electric Vaults. The main service electric vault shall not require sprinkler 
protection with the following conditions: 

      1.   The room shall be enclosed with two hour fire rated walls, floor and floor/ceiling 
assemblies. All doors shall have a 11/2 hour fire rating with closers. 

      2.   All other penetrations shall maintain the two hour fire rating. 

      3.   The room shall not be used for storage. 

      4.   The room shall have a floor drain. 

This area without sprinkler will not eliminate any sprinkler design alternatives which would 
apply to a fully sprinklered building. 

Section 905.3.8 Standpipes Where Required, add the new section: 

When the fire department hose lay from where the fire department establishes operations to 
any point in the building exceeds 150 feet a class I standpipe system is required. 

Section 907.2.24, add the following: 

Systems Out Of Service: Fire alarm systems shall be maintained in service at all times. Systems 
shall not be out of service for more than forty eight (48) hours for maintenance or repair. 

Section 916, add the following section: 

Carbon Monoxide Detectors 

Section 916.1 Definitions 

Carbon Monoxide Alarm An electrical device, which meets the requirements of UL standard 
2034 for detecting and warning individuals of the presence of carbon monoxide. 

Carbon Monoxide Monitor An electrical device for detecting and warning individuals of the 
presence of carbon monoxide. These devices do not meet UL standard 2034 because they 
detect and alarm smaller quantities of carbon monoxide than UL 2034 allows. 

Section 916.2 General 

      1.   Carbon monoxide alarms where required by this code shall meet the current UL standard 
2034 or its equivalent. Carbon monoxide alarms shall be installed per the requirements of NFPA 
720. 



1344038.1 
7 

      2.   Carbon monoxide monitors where allowed by this code shall be installed and maintained 
per the manufacturer's recommendations. 

      3.   All carbon monoxide monitor wiring must be in its own raceway. 

Section 916.3 Where Required - Living Spaces 

      1.   Carbon monoxide alarms are required in any building with sleeping facilities that relies 
on combustion of fossil fuel for heat, ventilation, hot water, or fireplace within the building, and 
for buildings with attached garages. 

         a.   Exception No. 1 Sleeping facilities in existing buildings built under and in full 
compliance with the codes in force at the time of construction or alteration thereof and that 
have been properly maintained and continually occupied as originally permitted. 

         b.   Exception No. 2 Carbon monoxide alarms may be replaced by carbon monoxide 
monitors where individuals, whose age, pregnancy or chronic health conditions make them 
adversely susceptible to low levels of carbon monoxide. 

      2.   In buildings with multi-sleeping facilities, with completely separate fossil fueled steam or 
hot water heating appliances are located in an area completely separated from the sleeping 
quarters, the carbon monoxide alarm does not need to be in the sleeping area but must have 
one alarm in the fossil fueled appliances area. 

      3.   Existing buildings, with sleeping facilities, that are renovated or altered and the work 
would normally require a city permit to accomplish, after adoption of this ordinance shall be 
required to install a carbon monoxide alarm per this ordinance. 

      4.   Existing buildings with sleeping facilities that replace a furnace or hot water heater with 
a fossil fueled furnace or hot water heater or install a fireplace shall be required to install a 
carbon monoxide alarm per this ordinance. 

Section 1011.101009.9 Spiral Stairways (page 331232), amend the first paragraph to read as 
follows: 

"Spiral stairways are not permitted to be used as a component of means of egress within a 
dwelling unit. Spiral stairways (in other than dwellings) are permitted to be used as a 
component of means of egress from a space not more than 250 square feet in area and serving 
not more than five occupants, or from galleries, catwalks and gridirons in accordance with 
section 410.51014.6". 

Section 1013.2 Height (page 236), delete exception number 3. 

Section 1612.3, date of flood study not applicable. 

Section 1801.31801.2, add the following new section: 

Wood Footings And Foundations: The use of wood footing and foundation systems is not 
allowed. 



1344038.1 
8 

Section 3410.2, insert date of original code adoption. 

Chapter 35 Referenced Standards. 

   ICC, delete the following codes: 

International private sewage disposal code - 2009. 

International urban-wildland interface code - 2009. 

International plumbing code, all references to the international plumbing code shall be changed 
to the Illinois plumbing code - 2004.2018 

   NFPA, all volumes of the national fire code with referenced standards and not the 
recommended practices. The most current edition on the date of adoption of this ordinance. 

The following appendices or sections of the appendices shall be adopted: D, H105, H106, I and 
J. 

(Ord. O-23-10, 5-24-2010) 

   B.   International Residential Code: 

      1.   Code Adopted; Amendments: The Iinternational rResidential Ccode, 20092024 edition, 
as published February 2009 by the International Code Council, Inc., is adopted as the residential 
construction code of the Vvillage of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, for the control of 
properties, buildings and structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, 
provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of the Iinternational Rresidential Ccode, 20092024 
Vedition, are referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this subsection, 
with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes as follows: 

Section R101.1 Title (page 261) - Insert in blank "the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section R103 (page 2671) - Delete "Code Compliance Agencydepartment building  safety" and 
insert "department of public health and safety". 

Section R103.1 Creation Of Enforcement Agency (page 271) shall read: 

"The department of public health and safety shall be responsible for the inspection and 
enforcement of this code. The director public health and safety shall be known as the building 
official." 

Section R103.2 Appointments (page 271) - Delete, "The code official shall be appointed by the 
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction" and insert "The code official shall be hired in 
accordance with the standard procedures of the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section R105.2 Work Exempt From Permit (page 283) - Amend "Building" by deleting items 
number 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 9 and 10. 

Section R108.2 Fees - Add the following sentence: 



1344038.1 
9 

All fees shall be as established by the village of Forest Park fee schedule. 

Section R112 Board Of Appeals - Delete the entire section see the appeal requirements in the 
building code. 

S 

R-301.2 (1) Climatic & Geographic Design Criteria Table 

Ground snow load 30 P.S.F. 
Wind speed 107 mph, 3 second gust - fig 301.2(4) 
 85 mph, fastest mile - table 301.2.1.3 

Seismic design category B 
Weathering Severe 
Frost line depth 42" below finished grade (minimum) 
Termite Slight to moderate 
Decay Slight to moderate 
Winter design temperature -4 degrees Fahrenheit 
Ice shield underlayment required Yes 
Flood hazards Contact engineering 
Air freezing index 1750 
Mean annual temperature 50 degrees Fahrenheit 
Illinois Energy Code   

ection R301.2(1) Climatic And Geographic Design Criteria (page 24) shall be amended to read as 
follows: 

Ground 

Snow 

Load 

Wind 

Speed 

(mph) 

Seismic 

Design 

Category 



1344038.1 
10 

Subject To Damage From 

Winter Design Temp. 

Weathering 

Frost Line Depth 

Termite 

Decay 

25 psf 

90 mph 

Zone B 

Severe 

42" 

Moderate to heavy 

Slight to moderate 

-4°F 

Ice Shield Under-layment Required Flood Hazard Air Freezing Index Mean Annual Temp 
Yes Refer to FIRM 2000 45°F 

Section R302.5.1 Opening Protection shall have the following added: 

Doors shall be equipped with an U.L. approved self closer. There shall be a six inch high curbing 
provided at the common walls between the garage and the habitable space, or the garage floor 
shall be constructed not less than six inches below the adjoining floor. Opening from a garage 
directly into a room used for sleeping purposes shall not be permitted. 

Table 302.6 - Change 1/2 inch gypsum to 5/8th type X gypsum. 

Add the following to the row: 

"from habitable rooms above garage (ceiling, walls, beams and columns)". 

Section R303.3 435.3 Bathroom (page 11353) shall be amended to read: 

"Bathrooms, water closets and similar rooms shall be mechanically vented to the exterior 
(directly or with duct work) using wall louvers or roof caps with insect screens. Vent discharge 
shall be directly to the exterior of the building. The minimum ventilation rate shall be 50 cfm for 
intermittent ventilations or 20 cfm for continuous ventilation." 

Section R303.3 325.2 Bathrooms (page 11353) - Delete exemptions. 



1344038.1 
11 

Section R 311.2 318.2 - Insert the following: 

"All single family detached dwellings shall have a minimum of two separate means of egress 
doors. The overhead garage door can notcannot be one of the required egress doors". 

Section R 313 309 shall be changed as follows: 

Section R309.1 313.2 One And Two Family Automatic Fire Systems - Delete the exception and 
add the following: 

"Additions 

      1.   Any structure where the footprint of the building is increased by more than 50% over a 
three year period". 

Section R313.3.2.1309.2.1 - Add the following: 

"Sprinklers shall be installed in attached garages to protect common wall ceilings and openings. 
The location and coverage shall be determined by the fire code official". 

Chapter 11 Energy Conservation - Delete the chapter in its entirety and insert the Iinternational 
Eenergy Cconservation Ccode per the Illinois law. 

Section G2412.9 - Add the following: 

"Multi family detached buildings shall have separate gas meter and piping system for each 
dwelling unit and public area". 

Chapters 25 through chapter 32 - Delete in their entirety and insert the Illinois plumbing code. 

Chapters 34 through chapter 43 - Delete in their entirety and insert the electric code as 
adopted by the Vvillage of Forest Park. 

Chapter 4344 Referenced Standards. 

   ICC - Delete the following codes: 

International private sewage disposal code - 20032009. 

International Pplumbing Ccode - All references to the international plumbing code shall be 
changed to the Illinois Pplumbing Ccode - 2004. 2018 

The following appendices or sections of the appendices shall be adopted: BA,BE, BF, BG, BO. CA, 
CB,CC,CE, A, B, C, D, E, F, G, H, J, K. 

(Ord. O-30-10, 5-24-2010) 

   C.   International Mechanical Code: 

      1.   Code Adopted; Amendments: The internationalInternational mMechanical cCode, 2009 
2024 edition, as published by the International Code Council, Inc., is adopted as the mechanical 



1344038.1 
12 

code of the Vvillage of Forest Park in the Sstate of Illinois, for the control of properties, 
buildings and structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, 
penalties, conditions and terms of the Iinternational mMechanical cCode, 20242009 edition, 
are referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this subsection, with the 
additions, insertions, deletions and changes as follows: 

Section 101.1 Title (page 111): Insert in blank "the village of Forest Park". 

Section 103 (page 122): Delete "Code Compliance Agencydepartment of inspection" and insert 
"department of public health and safety". 

Section 103.1 General (page 122) shall read: 

"The department of public health and safety shall be responsible for the inspection and 
enforcement of this code. The director public health and safety, or his designee shall be the 
code official responsible for the enforcement of this code." 

Section 103.2 Appointments (page 122): Delete, "The code official shall be appointed by the 
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction" and insert "The code official shall be hired in 
accordance with the standard procedures of the vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section 106.6.2 108.2 Fees: Insert the vvillage of Forest Park fee schedule. 

Section 108.4 114.4Violation Penalties: Insert the penalties from the village of Forest Park fee 
schedule. 

Section 109 112 Means Of Appeal: Delete the entire section. See the section on appeals in the 
building code. 

Chapter 15 Referenced Standards. 

   ICC: Delete the following codes: 

International private sewage disposal code - 2009. 

International urban-wildland interface code - 2009. 

International Pplumbing Ccode: All references to the Iinternational pPlumbing cCode shall be 
changed to the Illinois pPlumbing cCode - 20042018. 

   NFPA: All volumes of the national fire code with referenced standards and not the 
recommended practices. The most current edition on the date of adoption of this ordinance. 

The following appendices or sections of the appendices shall be adopted: A, B and C. 

(Ord. O-28-10, 5-24-2010) 

   D.   International Fuel Gas Code: 

      1.   Code Adopted; Amendments: The iInternational fFuel gGas cCode, 20242009 edition, as 
published by the International Code Council, Inc., is adopted as the fuel gas code of the Vvillage 



1344038.1 
13 

of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, for the control of properties, buildings and structures as 
herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms 
of the Iinternational fFuel gasGas Ccoode, 2024200910 edition, are referred to, adopted and 
made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this subsection, with the additions, insertions, deletions 
and changes as follows: 

Section 101.1 Title (page 101): Insert in blank "the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section 103 (page 132): Delete "dCode Compliance Agencyepartment of  inspection" and insert 
"department of public health and safety". 

Section 103.1 General (page13 2) shall read: 

"The department of public health and safety shall be responsible for the inspection and 
enforcement of this code. The director public health and safety, or his designee shall be the 
code official responsible for the enforcement of this code." 

Section 103.2 Appointments (page 132): Delete, "The code official shall be appointed by the 
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction" and insert "The code official shall be hired in 
accordance with the standard procedures of the village of Forest Park;" 

Section 106.6.2 108.2 Fees: Insert the village of Forest Park fee schedule. 

Section 113.4 108.4 Violation Penalties: Insert the penalties from the village of Forest Park fee 
schedule. 

Section 109 112Means Of Appeal: Delete the entire section. See the section on appeals in the 
building code. 

Section 401.6: Add the following: 

Multi family building and multi tenant commercial and industrial building shall have separate 
gas meter and piping system for each dwelling unit, public area and tenant space. 

Chapter 815 Referenced Standards. 

   ICC: Delete the following codes: 

International private sewage disposal code - 2009. 

International urban-wildland interface code - 2009. 

International  pPlumbing ccode: All references to the Iinternational Pplumbing Ccode shall be 
changed to the Illinois plumbing code - 20182004. 

   NFPA: All volumes of the Nnational Ffire Ccode with referenced standards and not the 
recommended practices. The most current edition on the date of adoption of this ordinance. 

The following appendices or sections of the appendices shall be adopted: A, B and C. 

(Ord. O-27-10, 5-24-2010) 



1344038.1 
14 

   E.   International Fire Code: 

      1.   Code Adopted; Amendments: The Iinternational fFire cCode, 20092024 edition, as 
published in February 2009 by the International Code Council, Inc., is adopted as the fire code 
of the village of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, for the control of properties, buildings and 
structures, fire hazards and hazardous materials as herein provided; and each and all of the 
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of the iInternational fFire cCode, 2024 
2009 edition, are referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this 
subsection, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes as follows: 

Section 101.1 Title (page 124): Insert in blank "the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section 102.4 Application Of The Building Code: Add the following: 

or the iInternational eExisting bBuilding cCode. 

Section 102.5 102.6 Historic Buildings: Add the following: 

or the iInternational eExisting bBuilding cCoode. 

Section 102.10102.11: Add the following: 

Other laws add the following: When there are conflicts between this code and any other code 
or standard adopted or referenced by this code or other Vvillage of Forest Park codes, the 
stricter of the requirements shall apply. 

Section 103.2 Appointment (page 225) shall read: 

"The fire chief or his designate shall be the fire code official." 

Section 202 Definition Of Fire Apparatus Access Road: Delete the term public street from the 
definition. 

Delete sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.101 and insert: 

All new buildings of any group shall require an automatic sprinkler system. 

Exception: Detached structures, which comply with all of the following, do not require 
automatic fire sprinklers: 

      1.   Less than five hundred (500) square feet in area. 

      2.   Single story. 

      3.   Not used as a dwelling or sleeping unit. 

      4.   Not an high hazard group. 

      5.   Not used for high hazard products or hazardous materials. 

      6.   No basements. 



1344038.1 
15 

      7.   Minimum separation to other buildings 20 feet. 

When a building has a change of use or is renovated and all of the following conditions occurs, 
it shall have a complete automatic sprinkler system. 

      1.   The wall and ceiling finish for more than 75% of the walls and ceilings is removed. 

      2.   New walls are constructed which equal more than 75% of the existing wall and ceiling 
surface. The square footage of both sides is used when both sides of the wall are exposed to 
the building interior. 

      3.   The building renovation exceeds 75% of the replacement cost of the building. The Dodge 
report or the Means report are used to establish construction and replacement costs. 

      4.   The building or space has a total of more than 2,500 square feet. 

Add new section: 

Section 903.3.7903.3.10 Outside Sprinkler Alarm Devices: The outside alarm device for fire 
sprinkler systems shall be a horn strobe in a location approved by the fire department. 

Add new section: 

Section 903.3.8 903.3.11 Floor Plans: When any building has multiple risers on any floor a floor 
layout for the sprinkler system showing all sprinkler zones shall be provided at the main 
sprinkler riser. 

Add new section: 

Section 903.3.9 903.3.12 Electric Vaults: The main service electric vault shall not require 
sprinkler protection with the following conditions: 

      1.   The room shall be enclosed with two hour fire rated walls, floor and floor/ceiling 
assemblies. All doors shall have a 11/2 hour fire rating with closers. 

      2.   All other penetrations shall maintain the two hour fire rating. 

      3.   The room shall not be used for storage. 

      4.   The room shall have a floor drain. 

This area without sprinkler will not eliminate any sprinkler design alternatives which would 
apply to a fully sprinklered building. 

Section 905.3.8 Standpipes Where Required: Add the new section: 

When the fire department hose lay from where the fire department establishes operations to 
any point in the building exceeds 150 feet a class I standpipe system is required. 

Section 907.2.24: Add the following: 



1344038.1 
16 

Systems Out Of Service: Fire alarm systems shall be maintained in service at all times. Systems 
shall not be out of service for more than forty eight (48) hours for maintenance or repair. 

Section 1009.9 1011.10.1 Spiral Stairways (page 130215): Amend the first paragraph to read as 
follows: 

"Spiral stairways are not permitted to be used as a component of means of egress within a 
dwelling unit. Spiral stairways (in other than dwellings) are permitted to be used as a 
component of means of egress from a space not more than 250 square feet in area and serving 
not more than five occupants, or from galleries, catwalks and gridirons in accordance with 
section 1014.6." 

Section 1013.2 1014.2 Height (page 135122): Delete exception number 3. 

Section 3204.2.9.6.1: Insert: 

This applies to the municipality in its entirety. 

Section 3206.2.4.4: Insert: 

This applies to the municipality in its entirety. 

Section 3506.2: Insert: 

This applies to the municipality in its entirety. 

Section 3804.2: Insert: 

This applies to the municipality in its entirety. 

Section 4603.51103.6..1 Standpipes: Change 50 feet to 40 feet. 

Section 4603.6.61103.7.6: Group R-2 change automatic or manual to automatic and manual 
and change 16 dwelling units to ten (10) or more dwelling units. 

Delete exception #2 

Section 1104.05.014604.5.2 Exit Stair Illumination: All means of egress stairs in building which 
require emergency illumination shall have emergency illumination in the means of egress 
stairways. 

   ICC: Delete the following codes: 

International urban-wildland interface code - 2009. 

International Pplumbing ccode: All references to the iinternational Pplumbing cCode shall be 
changed to the Illinois Pplumbing Ccode - 20182004. 

   NFPA: All volumes of the Nnational Ffire Ccode with referenced standards and not the 
recommended practices. The most current edition on the date of adoption of this ordinance. 



1344038.1 
17 

The following appendices shall be adopted: A, B, C, D, E, F, G, H, I, J. 

(Ord. O-26-10, 5-24-2010) 

   F.   International Existing Building Code: 

      1.   Code Adopted; Amendments: The Iinternational eExisting bBuilding Ccode,  20242009 
edition, as published by the International Code Council, Inc., is adopted as the existing building 
code of the Vvillage of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, for the control of properties, buildings 
and structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, 
conditions and terms of the international existing building code, 2009 edition, are referred to, 
adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this article, with the additions, insertions, 
deletions and changes as follows: 

Section 101.1 Title (page 121): Insert in blank "the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section 103 (page 133): Delete "Code Compliance Agencydepartment of building  safety" and 
insert "department of public health and safety". 

Section 103.1 General (page 133) shall read: 

"The department of public health and safety shall be responsible for the inspection and 
enforcement of this code. The director public health and safety, or his designee shall be the 
code official responsible for the enforcement of this code." 

Section 103.2 Appointments (page13 3): Delete, "The code official shall be appointed by the 
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction" and insert "The code official shall be hired in 
accordance with the standard procedures of the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section 108.2 Fees: Insert the Vvillage of Forest Park fee schedule. 

Section 112 Means Of Appeal: Delete entire section. See the section on appeals in the building 
code. 

Section 113.4 Violation Penalties: Insert the penalties from the vViillage of Forest Park fee 
schedule. 

Section 1301.101392.1.7: Add the following: 

The assigned point value for the building shall not change or affect the local amendments in any 
of the adopted codes. A point value which indicates code compliance without the required fire 
protection systems is not applicable and does not demonstrate code compliance. 

   NFPA: All volumes of the national fire code with referenced standards and not the 
recommended practices. The most current edition on the date of adoption of this ordinance. 

(Ord. O-24-10, 5-24-2010) 

   G.   International Energy Conservation Code: 



1344038.1 
18 

      1.   Code Adopted; Amendments: The Iinternational Eenergy cConservation Ccode, 
20212009 edition, as published in February 2009 by the International Code Council, Inc., is 
adopted as the energy conservation code of the Vvillage of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, 
for the control of properties, buildings and structures as herein provided; and each and all of 
the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of the Iinternational energyEnergy 
CVconservation Ccode, 202142009 edition, are referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as 
if fully set out in this subsection, with the additions, insertions, deletions ,and  changes and all 
state amendments as follows: 

Section 101.1 Title: Insert in blank "the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Chapter 104 Referenced Standards. 

   ICC: Delete the following codes: 

International private sewage disposal code - 2009. 

International Ppllumbing cCoode: All references to the Iinternational Pplumbing Ccode shall be 
changed to the Illlinois Pplumbing Ccode - 20182004. 

(Ord. O-25-10, 5-24-2010) 

   H.   International Property Maintenance Code: 

      1.   Code Adopted; Amendments: The Iinternational P property mMaintenance cCode, 
202109 edition, as published by the International Code Council, Inc., is adopted as the property 
maintenance code of the Vvillage of Forest Park in the state of Illinois, for the control of 
properties, buildings and structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, 
provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of the inInternational pProperty mMaintenance 
cCode, 202409 edition, are referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in 
this subsection, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes as follows: 

Section 101.1 Title (page 91): Insert in blank "the Vvillage of Forest Park". 

Section 103 (page 102): Delete "dCode Compliance Agency epartment of property maintenance 
inspection" and insert "department of public health and safety". 

Section 103.1 General (page  102) shall read: 

"The department of public health and safety shall be responsible for the inspection and 
enforcement of this code. The director public health and safety, or his designee shall be the 
code official responsible for the enforcement of this code." 

Section 103.2 Appointments (page 102): Delete, "The code official shall be appointed by the 
chief appointing authority of the jurisdiction" and insert "The code official shall be hired in 
accordance with the standard procedures of the vvillage of Forest Park." 

Section 104.1103.5 Fees: Insert the Vvillage of Forest Park fee schedule. 



1344038.1 
19 

Section 1076.4 Violation Penalties: Insert the penalties from the village of Forest Park fee 
schedule. 

Section 111 106 Means Of Appeal: Delete entire section. See the section on appeals in the 
building code. 

Section 302.4 Weeds: Insert 10 inches. 

Section 404 Overcrowding: Delete the entire section and insert the following: 

Section 404.5: Dwelling units shall not be occupied by more than permitted by the minimum 
area requirements of table 404.5. 

   Table 404.5 

   Minimum Area Requirements 

Space 

Minimum Area In Square Feet 

1-2 Occupants 

3-5 Occupants 

6 Or More Occupants 

Living room a,b 

No requirements 

120 

150 

Dining rooma,b 

No requirements 

80 

100 

Bedrooms 

Shall comply with section 404.4 

          a.      See section 404.5.2 for combined living room/dining room spaces. 

         b.      See section 404.5.1 for limitations on determining the minimum occupancy area for 
sleeping purposes. 



1344038.1 
20 

Section 404.5.1 Sleeping Area: The minimum occupancy area required by table 404.5 shall not 
be included as a sleeping area in determining the minimum occupancy area for sleeping 
purposes. All sleeping areas shall comply with section 404.4. 

Section 404.5.2: Combined living room and dining room spaces shall comply with the 
requirements of table 404.5 if the total area is equal to that required for separate rooms if the 
space is located so as to function as a combination living room/dining room. 

Section 602.2 Insect Screens: Insert April 1 and November 1. 

Section 602.3: Insert October 1 to April 1. 

Section 602.4: Insert October 1 to April 1. 

Chapter 158 Referenced Standards. 

   ICC: Delete the following codes: 

International plumbing code: All references to the Iinternational Pplumbing Ccode shall be 
changed to the Illinois pPlumbing Ccode - 20042218. 

International zoning code - 2009. 

   NFPA: All volumes of the Nnational Ffire Ccode with referenced standards and not the 
recommended practices. The most current edition on the date of adoption of this ordinance. 

The following appendices or sections of the appendices shall be adopted: A. 

(Ord. O-29-10, 5-24-2010) 

   I.   National Electric Code: 

      1.   Code Adopted: The Nnational eElectric cCode, 20232008 edition, as published by the 
National Fire Protection Association, Inc., is adopted as the electric code of the village of Forest 
Park in the state of Illinois, for the control of properties, buildings and structures electric 
systems as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, 
conditions and terms of the Nnational eElectric cCode, 20232008 edition, are referred to, 
adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this subsection, with the additions, 
insertions, deletions and changes as follows: 

A certain document, one copy of which is on file in the office of the village clerk of the vViillage 
of Forest Park, being marked and designated as the NFPA 70 nNational electrical codeElectric 
Code, 2023 2008 edition, as published by the National Fire Protection Association be and is 
hereby adopted as and shall be known as the electrical code of the Vvillage of Forest Park, 
governing installations of electric conductors and equipment within or on public or private 
building or other structures, including mobile homes, recreational vehicles, and floating 
buildings; and other premises such as yards, carnival, parking, and other lots and industrial 
substations; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of 
the NFPA 70 Nnational Eelectrical Ccode, 2023 2008 edition, are hereby referred to, adopted, 



1344038.1 
21 

and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this chapter, with the additions, insertions, 
deletions and changes prescribed in this chapter. It shall be mandatory that all equipment, 
material, devices, and appliances covered by the provisions of this code shall be tested and 
listed by a standard testing laboratory, of nationally accepted stature, which performs services 
equal to, or greater than, in those performed by the Underwriters Laboratories, Inc. In those 
instances where it is impossible to receive such a listing or label, the department of code 
administration shall make the determination of acceptability. 

         a.   Definitions: As used in this subsection: 

   CODE OFFICIAL: The director of public health and safety or other designated authority 
charged with the administration and enforcement of this code, or a duly authorized 
representative. 

   ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR: Any person, firm, or corporation engaged in the business of 
installing or altering by contract, electrical equipment for the utilization of electricity supplied 
for light, heat, or power, not including apparatus, conductors, or other equipment installed for, 
or by, public utilities, including common carriers which are under the jurisdiction of the Illinois 
commerce commission for use in their operation as public utilities; but the term "electrical 
contractor" does not include employees employed by any person, firm, or corporation to 
supervise such work. 

   ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT: Conductors and equipment installed for the utilization of the 
electricity supplied for light, heat, or power, but does not include radio apparatus or equipment 
for wireless reception of sounds and signals, and does not include apparatus, conductors and 
other equipment installed for, or by, public utilities, including common carriers, which are 
under the jurisdiction of the Illinois commerce commission for use in their operation as public 
utilities. 

   OWNER-OCCUPANT: Any person who is the owner and occupant of a single-family detached 
residence, not being used for any rental purposes, where specific electrical work is to be done. 

         b.   Department Of Code Administration: The department of public health and safety is 
responsible for enforcing the rules and regulations relating to the installation and alteration and 
use of all electrical equipment, as herein provided. 

         c.   Permits Required: 

            (1)   Any person, firm or corporation installing or altering electrical equipment shall apply 
to the department of code administration for an electrical permit. Electrical plans and 
specifications for proposed installation or alteration of multiple-family dwellings, commercial or 
industrial, must be submitted to the department of public health and safety for approval and 
shall be sealed by a registered architect or professional engineer. The approved plans shall be 
available on the job site at all times. 

            (2)   Permits for work performed under this code may be issued only to registered 
electrical contractors or to the owner-occupant of single-family detached residences doing their 



1344038.1 
22 

own work, except that all service installations and upgrades shall be done by registered 
electrical contractors. Electrical contractors shall furnish bona fide proof of their current 
electrical contractor's registration. Owners shall satisfy the prequalification provisions of the 
city prior to being granted a permit. 

            (3)   Work on rental property by other than registered and bonded contractors is not 
permitted. 

            (4)   Contractors should apply for and secure permits rather than require the owner to do 
it. 

            (5)   Homeowners that are issued a permit and that enlist the services of a contractor for 
help or assistance are required to use a registered and bonded contractor. 

            (6)   Permits for service upgrades or new services will only be issued to registered electric 
contractors. 

            (7)   Work shall be defined as the installation of new conduit, tube, pipe, wiring system, 
replacement of wire within existing pipe, conduit or tubes, installation of new wire or the 
replacement or enlargement of the service. It shall not include the replacement of a switch, 
receptacle or fixture. 

         d.   Inspections Required: 

            (1)   Electrical Work Inspected: Electrical work shall be inspected prior to being concealed 
or covered and upon completion. Failure to receive an approved required inspection shall result 
in the uncovering or opening up for inspection at the direction of the code official. All safety 
and code compliance of work performed shall be the continuing responsibility of the permit 
applicant. A final inspection approval is required by the village of Forest Park. The permit shall 
be responsible for ensuring that a final inspection is completed by the village of Forest Park 
appropriate inspector immediately upon completion of the permitted project. A permit which 
does not show any inspection to confirm continuing work for over a six (6) month period, shall 
be considered expired. A renewal fee may be paid to extend the permit prior to its expiration. 

            (2)   Service Installation Inspection: When a temporary or permanent service is installed, 
the applicant shall request an inspection. The code official shall then notify the local utility upon 
approval of the work. 

            (3)   Notice Of Approval: The department of public health and safety shall be notified 
eight (8) regular working hours in advance for service, underslab, rough and final inspection. 
When the work has been approved, a notice of approval will be posted on or in the building. 

            (4)   Required Electric Inspections: The following inspections are required and this text is 
to be used as a guide. There are potentially more inspections to be performed however they 
are too numerous to list, so be sure to consult with the electric inspector and/or code official 
prior to assuming or acting in such a manner as to conceal any work without approvals being 
provided. 



1344038.1 
23 

Underground: Open trench - prepour - before backfill and/or concrete is poured. All conduits 
installed and properly supported. 

A safe and hazard free means of access shall be provided to perform the electric underground 
inspections. A dry means shall be provided for foot traffic to perform the electric underground 
inspections. 

Service: Complete. Meter trim, main panel, service entrance conductors, grounding conductors, 
bonding conductors, bonding bushings, ground rod, ground identification tags, conduit(s), 
conduit supports. 

If the water meter is not installed at the time of service inspection, conduit shall be installed for 
water ground and cable shall be installed in said conduit coiled up ready for installation when 
the water meter is installed. 

A safe and hazard free means of access shall be provided to perform the electric service 
inspection. Basements shall be free of standing water and mud. If this is not possible, a dry 
means shall be provided for foot traffic to perform the electric inspection. 

Ceiling: Before ceiling tile or other ceiling finishes are applied (industrial and commercial). 

Rough-In: A rough-in inspection is required after the roof, framing, fire blocking and bracing are 
in place and all components to be concealed are complete. No wires installed. 

All conduit(s) shall be installed including the required conduit(s) for low voltage installations. 

Final: All electric work complete and all devices connected, installed and functional. 

All appliances are to be installed and functional. 

Panels shall be labeled legibly and directory shall be affixed to the panel cover. 

         e.   Reinspection Fees: Reinspection fees will be charged for any inspection that is not 
ready at seven o'clock (7:00) A.M. for A.M. inspections and twelve o'clock (12:00) noon for P.M. 
inspections. 

         f.   Adoption Of Local Utility Company Information And Requirements For The Supply Of 
Electric Service: 

            (1)   Installations, Alterations And Use Of Equipment: The provisions of the rules and 
regulations regarding the installations, alterations, and use of electrical equipment as last 
adopted by the electrical supply company now supplying the village are hereby made a part of 
this subsection. A copy of such rules and regulations shall be on file in the department of code 
administration. 

            (2)   Adoption Of Metering Sequences And Location Of Metering Equipment: The 
provisions of the rules and regulations regarding the installation, alteration, and use of 
metering equipment as last adopted by the local utility company now supplying the city and 
identified as operating instruction are, hereby, made a part of this subsection; a copy of such 



1344038.1 
24 

rules and regulations being now on file in the office of the department of public health and 
safety. 

         g.   Service Capacity And Equipment; All Occupancies: 

            (1)   Minimum Service Capacity: The minimum service capacity for each dwelling unit 
shall be a one hundred (100) amp service with a minimum twenty (20) branch circuit panel. 
Four (4) spaces for branch circuits shall be provided for future use. Split bus and tandem 
breakers are prohibited. Panel schedules and load calculations shall be required for each 
installation. 

            (2)   Means Of Disconnection: Where the disconnecting means is installed within a 
building it shall be located within five feet (5') of the point where such conduit enters the 
building. 

            (3)   Service Entrance Conductors: Service entrance conductors shall be continuous 
(without splice), from service head to meter fitting and service disconnecting means. Duplex 
service entrance conductors shall have an ampacity of two (2) #1 and one #2 copper conductors 
when one service riser is used in an overhead installation. All single-family and duplex dwellings 
requiring separate riser installation shall have a minimum service capacity of three (3) #3 
copper conductors. 

Note: Revision of services not requiring a change in service panel may continue the use of 
tandem breakers. All other revisions will conform to new service requirements. 

            (4)   Service Risers: Service risers shall be steel rigid metal conduit from service head to 
disconnecting means. Electrical metallic tubing may be used for temporary services. Service 
risers shall be a minimum of one and one-fourth inches (11/4") in size and a minimum of two 
and one-half inches (21/2") in size when used as a support for the service drop. Roof plates 
shall not be used as a service drop support. 

            (5)   Panels: Panels shall be installed in each occupancy in newly constructed buildings. 
Each service main breaker must be marked so it is easily identified as to which unit is being 
served, twenty (20) circuit minimum. 

            (6)   Fittings: There shall be no junction or outlet boxes in a service run. Weathertight 
fittings shall be used in service runs from service head to meter cabinets. Revision of services 
shall conform to new service requirements. 

         h.   Grounding: 

            (1)   Services shall be grounded to a metallic cold water pipe and to a supplementary 
electrode, as provided by the national electrical code. Where this supplementary electrode is a 
ground rod, the rod shall be minimum five-eighths inch by eight feet (5/8" x 8') one pieceone-
piece copper clad or stainless clad rod driven to a depth of at least nine feet six inches (9'6"). 
Where ground rods are used, there shall be one rod installed for services up to four hundred 
(400) amps and two (2) rods installed for services larger than four hundred (400) amps with 



1344038.1 
25 

spacing between rods as per the national electrical code. Ground rods for four hundred (400) 
amp and larger will be three-fourths inch by ten feet (3/4" x 10') long. 

            (2)   Grounding to building fire sprinkler systems is prohibited. 

            (3)   The grounding electrode conductor shall be an insulated copper conductor. This 
conductor shall be routed to avoid physical damage to the conductor, and connected to street 
side of water meter. No projections of the ground rod shall be left above to present a hazard. 
Connection to the ground rod shall be made using a listed direct burial "acorn" type connector 
(revised pipe clamp connectors should not be used on ground rods). 

            (4)   A bonding conductor shall be installed around the water meter and shutoff valves on 
all services. 

            (5)   An equipment bonding jumper shall be used to connect the grounding terminal of a 
grounding type receptacle to a grounded box (NEC 250-146, deleting exceptions A through D). 

            (6)   Electrical continuity at service equipment where concentric or eccentric knockouts 
are used shall be assured by the use of bonding type (grounding) buildings. 

            (7)   All raceways in other than residential occupancies shall contain an insulated 
grounding conductor sized in accordance with the national electrical code and bonded to all 
metallic boxes, wiring devices, motors, utilization equipment, and all devices requiring 
grounding. 

            (8)   Spas, hot tubs, hydromassagehydro massage bathtub pumps and equipment shall be 
bonded to the nearest continuous metallic cold water pipe. Their dedicated circuits shall be 
GFCI. 

         i.   Wiring Methods: 

            (1)   The following wiring methods shall be prohibited. Delete the following articles: 

Article 320 armored cable. 

Article 322 flat cable assemblies: type FC. 

Article 324 flat conductor cable: type FCC. 

Article 326 integrated gas spacer cable: type IGS. 

Article 328 medium voltage cable: type MV. 

Article 330 metal clad cable: type MC. 

Article 332 mineral insulated, metal sheathed cable: type MI. 

Article 334 nonmetallic sheathed cable: types NM, NMC and NMS. 

Article 336 power and control tray cable: type TC. 



1344038.1 
26 

Article 338 service entrance cable: type SE and USE. 

Article 340 underground feeder and branch circuit cable: type UF. 

Article 352 rigid nonmetallic conduit: type RNC. 

Article 353 high density polyethylene conduit: type HDPE. 

Article 354 nonmetallic underground conduit with conductors: type NUCC. 

Article 356 liquid tight flexible nonmetallic conduit: type LNFC. 

Article 360 flexible metallic tubing: type FMT. 

Article 362 electrical nonmetallic tubing: type ENT. 

Article 370 cable bus. 

Article 378 nonmetallic wire ways. 

Article 382 nonmetallic extensions. 

Article 388 surface nonmetallic raceways. 

Article 394 concealed knob and tube wiring. 

Article 396 messenger supported wiring. 

Article 398 open wiring on insulators. 

Article 604 manufactured wiring systems. 

Chapter 9 table 5A. 

Open wiring on insulators. 

Delete the use of aluminum wiring throughout the code. 

            (2)   When electric services are upgraded in existing residential occupancies, all new 
wiring in exposed areas shall be installed in conduit. Existing flexible wiring methods concealed 
in walls may be exposed for a maximum of eighteen inches (18") in exposed areas in order to 
connect to the new wiring system. Existing electrical systems which are of inadequate capacity 
shall be replaced with a new system or shall be supplemented with new wiring and equipment, 
as necessary, to meet the requirements of these guidelines. 

         j.   Outlet Boxes: 

            (1)   An outlet box shall be installed for all types of outlets. All outlet boxes shall be metal 
and they shall provide at least the minimum free space for the maximum number of wires 
indicated in the national electrical code. Boxes shall not be less than one and one-half inches 
(11/2") in depth unless it would be impossible, owing to the construction of the building. Boxes 



1344038.1 
27 

shall be fitted with covers and/or plates to form a complete enclosure. Unused and open 
knockouts shall be securely closed. 

            (2)   All boxes shall be fully accessible in a manner to permit inspection or modification of 
wiring contained therein without removing any portion of the structure of finished surfaces. 

            (3)   All outlet boxes shall be independently and solidly supported from the structure. 
Raceways entering boxes shall not be construed as proper support, nor shall the box be the 
support for the raceway. 

            (4)   A four inch (4") square box shall be used with suitable flush cover as outlet 
demands. Should it be impossible, owing to construction of the building, a single gem box with 
the depth not less than one and one-half inches (11/2") may be used, provided not more than 
one raceway enters. Ganging of gem boxes is prohibited in new construction. 

            (5)   A four inch (4") octagon box, minimum depth one and one-half inches (11/2"), may 
be used in unfinished basements or garages for lights, commercial or industrial lighting, when 
using a four inch (4") porcelain light receptacle or swivel type cover with rigid conduit stem to 
the light bulb socket, provided that not more than two (2) knockouts are used. A factory made 
assembly consisting of an octagon box may be used for paddle fans where specifically designed 
for that purpose. 

         k.   Fixtures And Outlets Required; Residential Occupancies: 

            (1)   The minimum number of outlets for connection of permanent lighting fixtures and 
convenience receptacles in residential buildings shall be as follows: a light shall be installed 
directly over every kitchen sink, bathroom lavatory, and utility sink in addition to the general 
lights in the room. Stairways, halls, passageways, corridors, garages, patios, basements, and 
rooms accessible by more than entry or exit shall have a ceiling light or outlet controlled by 
three-way or four-way switches, one lighting outlet for each three hundred (300) square feet, 
or fraction thereof, in basements or cellars. 

            (2)   All outlet receptacles shall be three (3) pole ground type and shall be installed so 
that no point along the floor line in any wall space is more than six feet (6'), measured 
horizontally, from an outlet in that space including any wall space two feet (2') wide or greater, 
and the wall space occupied by fixed panels in exterior walls. The receptacle outlets shall, 
insofar as practicable, be spaced equal distances apart. Floor receptacles may be installed in 
each hallway, foyer, or stair landing. Outside receptacles shall be watertight (GFCI protected 
and the proper cover over the cord connection) and approved receptacle to meet load 
requirement. 

            (3)   Not less than one fixture or wall receptacle in each room shall be controlled by a 
wall switch adjacent to entry doors. 

            (4)   An outside light fixture controlled by an interior switch or by photocell shall be 
installed at each entrance and porch. 



1344038.1 
28 

            (5)   Garages, attached or detached, shall have switch controlled interior lighting. At least 
one easily accessible GFCI receptacle shall be provided in each garage. 

            (6)   Each clothes closet or storage area of six (6) square feet, or larger, shall have a 
ceiling light. Walk-in closets shall have a light controlled by a wall switch. 

            (7)   All new construction shall have at least one general lighting circuit for each five 
hundred (500) square feet of area, or fraction thereof. 

            (8)   Smoke detectors shall be installed in each sleeping room, outside of each separate 
sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of the bedrooms and on each additional story of the 
dwelling, including basements and cellars but not including crawl spaces and uninhabitable 
attics. 

            (9)   Carbon monoxide detectors in hallways by the bedrooms. 

         l.   Conductors: 

            (1)   The use of aluminum conductors is prohibited. 

Exception: This shall not apply to temporary exterior overhead and direct burial wiring on 
construction sites covered by a current electrical permit. 

            (2)   All conductors shall be insulated and of a type approved for the purpose for which 
they are used. 

Exception: Uninsulated conductors may be placed in the earth for purposes of forming a 
grounding grid. 

            (3)   Conductors installed in raceways which are in concrete slabs or walls in direct 
contact with earth, fill, or are otherwise subject to excessive moisture, shall have not less than 
type THWN, MTW, and AWM insulation. 

            (4)   Connections of conductors to terminal parts shall be mechanically and electrically 
secure without damaging the conductors and shall be made by means of pressure connectors 
(including set screw type), or splices to flexible leads either soldered, brazed, or welded, except 
that #8 AWG or smaller conductors may be connected by means of clamps or screws with 
terminal plates having upturned lugs. Terminals for more than one conductor shall be so listed. 

            (5)   Conductors shall be so spliced or joined as to be mechanically and electrically 
secure. Joints must be soldered with a fusible metal or alloy, brazed, or welded, unless an 
approved splicing device is used. Insulation piercing type splicing devices shall be prohibited. All 
splices and joints and the free ends of conductors shall be covered with an insulation equal to 
that on the conductors. If the power supply wires to individual fixtures are cut, then each 
separate free conductor (pigtail), a minimum length of six inches (6") each, shall be provided 
and such splices shall conform to this section. 

         m.   Overcurrent Protection: 



1344038.1 
29 

            (1)   Except as may be specifically approved by the electrical inspector, each occupancy 
shall be provided with fuse or circuit breaker type branch circuit overcurrent devices for the 
number of circuits as required to serve the minimum loads stated herein, except that for single-
family dwellings, the minimum shall not be less than one circuit for every three hundred fifty 
(350) square feet, or fraction thereof, of floor areas. The floor area shall be computed from the 
outside dimensions of the building or area involved, including one-half (1/2) the area of 
basement, enclosed porches, garages, and breezeways. 

            (2)   Disconnects shall be installed within sight for all fractional horsepower motors, 
paddle fans, and water heating equipment. In commercial occupancies, disconnects shall be 
installed for all water equipment. 

            (3)   On new installations for buildings with new existing four hundred (400) amp or 
larger services, the permit applicant shall include load and fault current calculations to show 
methods utilized which will ensure that the available fault current will not exceed the ratings of 
all devices and equipment. 

         n.   Underground Service: 

            (1)   All detached structures requiring electrical service shall be served by underground 
conductors installed in an approved manner and shall be protected against physical damage 
with a minimum three-fourths inch (3/4"). 

All existing residential garages must contain a minimum of one 15-amp circuit, with one lamp 
holder, one wall switch, and one GFCI receptacle. All detached garages and/or outbuildings 
shall be supplied by an underground feeder only, using PVC or rigid conduit using minimum 
three (3) no. 12 conductors, one of the three (3) shall be a green or bare conductor, the ground 
conductor shall be case grounded to the metal junction box at each end, to ensure that the 
electric system of the garage or outbuilding is sufficiently grounded. 

In addition, all new attached or detached garages shall have a separate circuit and one lamp 
holder per stall plus one ceiling receptacle located for use of each electric door operator per 
door opening sized for automobiles. 

         o.   Raceways Or Conduit: 

            (1)   Approved Raceways: All interior installations or alterations shall be approved metal 
raceways. All raceways exposed to the weather shall be rigid steel metal conduit with approved 
boxes and fittings. Rigid aluminum conduit can only be used by special written permission from 
the code official. 

            (2)   Raceways In Concrete: Rigid steel metal conduit, PVC coated steel conduit, floor 
duct, and PVC schedule 40 to 80 are the only acceptable raceway types for use in concrete slabs 
if the slab is in any manner resting on, or contacting, the earth. Any permanently exposed risers 
emerging from the concrete base or slab shall be rigid steel metal conduit. 



1344038.1 
30 

            (3)   Underground Raceways: Rigid steel metal conduit, PVC coated steel conduit, and 
PVC schedule 40 or 80 are the only acceptable raceways types for use underground. Direct 
burial cable methods shall be prohibited. 

            (4)   Raceway Fittings: All raceway fittings, locknuts, bushings, couplings, or connectors 
shall provide secure mechanical and electrical joints. 

            (5)   Bushings: Where a raceway enters a box or other fitting, an insulating bushing shall 
be used to protect the wires from abrasion unless the design of the box or fitting is such as to 
afford equivalent protection. 

            (6)   Classified Areas: Intermediate metal conduit shall not be allowed in hazardous 
classified areas. 

            (7)   Temporary Services: Electrical metallic tubing shall be allowed for temporary 
services. 

            (8)   Fasteners: All raceways shall be securely fastened by means of an approved 
electrical fastener to the building structure at least every ten feet (10') and within three feet (3') 
of every box. 

         p.   Electric Signs: All wiring for permanent freestanding electrical signs and billboards shall 
be installed underground. 

         q.   Conflicts With Other Provisions: When the provisions of this subsection conflict with 
any other provision of the village of Forest Park code regulating the same subject matter, the 
more stringent or restrictive provision shall apply. 

      2.   Amendments: 

         a.   Requirements Service Upgrade Or Revision a/o Panel Upgrade Or Revision: All existing 
Greenfield, BX, Romex, knob & tube and the like entering the new panel(s) shall be removed 
and replaced with properly sized, approved wire and installed in an approved conduit system. 

            (1)   Removal and replacement of the above materials shall be taken back to a point 
where an approved spliced connection can be made without the removal of finished walls or 
ceilings. 

            (2)   All current service bonding and grounding codes shall apply to service and/or panel 
upgrades or revisions. 

         b.   All panels for installations other than residential shall be bolt on breakers and 
absolutely no aluminum or clad materials shall be utilized. All bus bars and the like shall be 
copper. All panel boards or distribution centers shall have a main breaker in each panel as well 
as any other required disconnecting means. In all cases, panel boards, whether primary or 
secondary, shall have an internal main breaker sized accordingly. 

All panel board installations that are installed below grade to a concrete or masonry wall shall 
be fastened to a moisture resistant sheet of plywood or approved equivalent. 



1344038.1 
31 

         c.   Notching: 

            (1)   Floor joists, ceiling joist, roof truss, shall not be notched for any electrical installation 
of materials, equipment or "devices". 

            (2)   Floor joists and/or ceiling joists may be drilled for the purpose of inserting a conduit 
system, however, it shall be noted that a minimum of two inches (2") of wood shall be 
remaining on the bottom of said floor joists and/or ceiling joists when the conduit system 
installation is complete. Any drilling shall be done in complete compliance with the 
specifications, plans and direction of the manufacturers' design engineer and such 
documentation shall be provided to the code official as necessary. If, during any inspection 
review, any floor joists and/or ceiling joists are found to be less than two inches (2") of wood 
remaining on the bottom of said construction materials, it shall be the responsibility of the 
electrical contractor, or person(s) for which an electrical permit has been issued, to replace any 
floor joists and/or ceiling joists to the original construction standards as set forth by the 
building codes as adopted by the village of Forest Park. 

         d.   Requirements For Exit Lights And Emergency Lights: 

            (1)   All exit signs and/or fixtures shall be a combination type, one hundred twenty (120) 
volt and a totally self-contained battery operated unit. All new and replacement installations of 
exit signs devices shall be of LED type fixtures. All exit signs shall be internally illuminated units, 
which shall consist of an approved LED illumination device, which shall operate one hundred 
twenty (120) volts and shall be capable of being operated from the internal battery unit. 

All exit signs, emergency egress lighting and the associated battery backup systems, are to be 
defined as components of emergency lighting systems. 

All circuit breakers utilized for the emergency system shall either be in a separate sub panel or 
an isolated, bottom right location, of the service panel. 

Lock out clamp on the breaker is mandatory. 

Any wires that are associated with any current that supplies electric energy to any of the so 
defined emergency system shall be independently piped from the source of power to the 
termination point. No other wires can occupy that raceway or any of its components except by 
written permission of the building code official of the city. 

            (2)   All exit signs and emergency lighting systems shall be battery operated, self 
containedself-contained units with a minimum of one and one-half (11/2) hour operating 
period and shall be maintained at all times to provide this requirement. 

            (3)   All wiring systems and/or circuiting installed for the purpose of the emergency 
system shall be installed in a separate conduit system and shall be completely independent and 
separate system and shall not intermingle with any other circuiting and/or wiring system that 
does not pertain to the said emergency system. 



1344038.1 
32 

            (4)   There shall be a separated identified neutral conductor installed for each emergency 
lighting circuit and/or connected to any other electrical device other than the dedicated 
emergency lighting circuit. 

            (5)   The minimum size of the branch circuit conductors for the entire emergency lighting 
system and to include the exit lighting system shall be #12 AWG gauge wires size minimum. 

            (6)   Breakers shall be used as the branch circuit protection device(s) of the emergency 
lighting system. 

            (7)   All branch circuit breakers or branch circuit fuse devices installed for the branch 
circuit wiring and/or circuiting of the emergency systems shall not exceed fifteen (15) amperes. 

110.8 Wiring Methods. The provisions of the 20082023 version of the Nnational Eelectrical 
Ccode (NFPA 70) for this section are adopted and are further amended by the adoption of the 
additional following language: 

110.8 Wiring Methods. 

(A)   All branch circuit conductors shall be connected to receptacles, switches, by the means of a 
screw terminal(s) that are designed and/or manufactured with the said device. 

The insertion and/or installation of any conductor into the screw-less terminals of any electrical 
device shall not be the accepted method of connection and/or installation of the conductor and 
will not be permitted. 

(B)   All branch circuit conductors shall be "made up" and/or spliced in such a manner as to 
provide a single conductor to be connected and/or installed to any electrical device screw 
terminal as the terminal(s) so designed and manufactured on receptacles, switches, fixtures, 
etc. 

Note: In a typical wiring installation the branch circuit conductor and/or the grounded neutral 
conductor is required to be cut and/or have open ends at the device, the conductors shall be 
spliced in such a manner as to provide a "pigtail" to properly attach and/or install the branch 
circuit conductor and/or the grounded neutral conductor to the said device. 

(C)   The continuity of any branch circuit conductor including any identified grounded neutral 
conductor shall not depend upon device connections, such as lamp holders, receptacles, etc., 
where the removal of such devices would interrupt the continuity. 

(D)   No more than one (1) conductor shall be connected and/or installed to a single screw 
terminal on any electrical device. 

110.9 Interrupting Rating (Circuit Breakers). The provisions of the 20082023 version of the 
Nnational Eelectrical Ccode (NFPA 70) for this section are adopted and are further amended by 
the adoption of the additional following language: 

110.9 Interrupting Rating (Circuit Breakers). 



1344038.1 
33 

(A) All circuit breakers shall be fully sized in dimensions and for proper insertion into the panel 
board, as set forth by the switchboard and panel board manufacturer and as listed by a 
recognized laboratory. Substitution in a space designed or previously occupied by a lesser 
number shall not be approved; (this includes tandem or duplex circuit breakers.) 

(B) The application and/or installation of connecting more than one (1) conductor to a circuit 
breaker terminal or a fuse holder terminal shall not be approved. 

(C) In wiring installation where it is required to install parallel sets of conductors, each 
conductor shall be connected and/or attached to a lug or terminal so designed or sized as to 
accept not more than one (1) conductor. 

(D) Commercial/Industrial: All branch circuit breakers including circuit breakers used for feeders 
and/or sub- feeders shall be of the bolt on type. 

(E) Exception: Existing residential dwellings that may conduct and/or convert a portion of said 
dwelling for day care services, may be permitted to utilize the existing wiring system and 
related branch circuiting in said dwelling, provided that said systems is in full compliance with 
other sections of this code, including bringing all existing non-complying systems to current 
requirements. 

210.8 Ground-Fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection For Personnel. The provisions of the 2008 
2023 version of the Nnational Eelectrical Ccode (NFPA 70) for this section are adopted and are 
further amended by the adoption of the additional following language: 

210.8 Ground Fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection For Personnel. GFCI protection for personnel - 
Note: All GFCI circuits shall be limited to being contained within the room or space of which 
they are required. 

210.8(A)(1) shall further require that when a GFCI or any receptacle protected by a GFCI circuit 
is installed, it shall not be within 24" of a tub, shower or whirlpool fixture unless separated by 
walls. 

210.8(A)(6) shall be further modified to require when there are three or more 
outlets/receptacles along any kitchen counter top, the outlets shall be wired in such a fashion 
as to provide a minimum of two separate circuits and such circuits shall be located at 
alternating locations along the counter top. 

210.11(C) Dwelling Units. The provisions of the 20232008 version of the nNational eElectrical 
cCode (NFPA 70) for this section are adopted and are further amended by the adoption of the 
additional following language: 

210.11(C) Dwelling Units. 

(3)   Bathroom Branch Circuits. 



1344038.1 
34 

In addition to the number of branch circuits required by other parts of this section, each and 
every residential bathroom shall have a separate 20-ampere circuit per bathroom to supply 
bathroom receptacle outlet(s). Such circuits shall have no other outlets. 

General lighting for residential bathrooms shall be independent from GFCI or AFCI protected 
circuits. 

Exception: Lights approved for the purpose directly over spas, whirlpools, steam rooms, 
showers, bathtubs and the like are required and shall be permitted to be supplied by the GFCI 
protected receptacle outlet circuit from the load side. 

(4)   Four 20 amp appliance branch circuits shall be added to the dwelling unit kitchen. One for 
each of the following: 

1.   Refrigerator, 2. Microwave 3. Disposal and 4. Dishwasher. These circuits shall not be 
connected to any other power-consuming device. 

Note: Where additional refrigeration equipment (such as freezers, wire coolers etc.) is installed, 
an additional dedicated twenty - (20) amp rated circuit shall be installed for each appliance. 

(5)   All permanently installed automatic dishwashers shall be "hard" wired with the use of 
electrical metallic tubing and a minimum of three eighths (3/8") trade size flexible metal 
conduit, which said flexible conduit shall not exceed six feet (6') in length. 

Each permanently installed automatic dishwasher shall have an approved disconnecting means 
for the purpose of disconnecting the ungrounded conductors. The disconnecting means shall be 
a minimum of twenty (20) ampere rated. There shall be a green ground wire installed in this 
wiring system. 

The disconnecting means shall be installed on the wall of the building structure or on the wall 
within the circuit and in the immediate vicinity of the automatic dishwasher appliance as 
approved by the building code official and/or electrical inspector. Disconnecting means 
installed within the cabinet and the immediate vicinity of the automatic dishwasher shall be 
mounted on a vertical wall. Disconnecting means mounted horizontally (bottom of said cabinet) 
will not be accepted. 

Disconnect switch for garbage disposal shall be no more than three (3) feet from centerline of 
disposal unit. A listed "button" type switch may be used on the backsplash if no wall space is 
available with the approval of the building official or electrical inspector. 

(6)   Laundry equipment (such as electric dryers) and electric cooking appliances (such as stoves, 
ranges, cook tops) that require two hundred and twenty (220/240) volts for operations shall be 
installed on separate and dedicated branch circuits. Said dedicated circuit(s) shall not be 
connected to and/or serve any other electrical device, appliance, and/or equipment. Said circuit 
shall be independently piped from source to termination. 



1344038.1 
35 

Note: The tapping of conductors and/or alteration or de-rating of any dedicated two hundred 
and twenty (220/240) volt circuit conductor for the purpose of supplying electricity to operate 
any one hundred and twenty (120) volt device shall not be permitted and will not be accepted. 

An identified neutral conductor shall be installed with all branch circuit conductors that operate 
at one hundred and twenty (120) or two hundred and forty (240) volts between conductors and 
said neutral conductor shall be sized equal to the rating of said branch circuit conductors. 

210.52(D) Bathrooms. Amend this section as follows: 

210.52(D) Bathrooms And Powder Rooms. 

            (1)   In dwelling units, at least one wall receptacle outlet shall be installed in bathrooms 
and powder rooms adjacent to the basin location. 

            (2)   An approved exhaust fan shall be installed in each bath-room. The plumbing and/or 
building inspector - having jurisdiction shall approve the methods of exhausting the bathroom 
to outside air. 

Note - Each bathroom and/or rooms that are required to be ventilated by an electrically 
operated mechanical means (such as by the use of an approved exhaust fan) shall be controlled 
by a wall switch. The switching device shall not control and/or operate any other device than 
the mechanical exhaust device and/or system. The light of the same unit shall be switched 
separately. 

            (3)   Switches to control the proper operation of the exhaust fan(s) and/or receptacles 
shall not be located and/or installed immediately adjacent to and/or directly over any sink and 
shall not be located and/or installed within two (2) feet of shower stalls, bath tubs, whirlpools, 
etc. 

210.52(E) Dwelling Units. The provisions of the 20232008 version of the nNational eElectrical 
cCode (NFPA 70) for this section are adopted and are further amended by the adoption of the 
additional following language: 

210.52(E) Outdoor Outlets. 

            (1)   A minimum of one (1) switched out of door weatherproofed duplex receptacle shall 
be installed and suitably located at the exterior, front and in the rear of a single family dwelling, 
apartment unit and/or apartment complex, condominium, townhouse, multifamily structures, 
etc. In all screened/three season or other recreational rooms attached to any building there 
shall be GFCI protection for all outlets, interior or exterior. 

Note: Weatherproofed duplex receptacles installed on the front and rear of an apartment unit 
and/or apartment complex or condominium for general maintenance purposes may not be 
required to be switched. 



1344038.1 
36 

            (2)   A minimum of one (1) out of door weatherproofed duplex receptacle shall be 
installed and suitably located on the exterior of any directly connected porch, patio, balcony, 
sun room, screened porch or any similar type structure. 

210.70(A)(2)(d) Add new section as follows: 

210.70(A)(2)(d) Basement Illumination. 

               (i)   A minimum of one (1) switched lighting fixture shall be installed in the immediate 
area of the top and bottom stair tread of all staircases that lead to any basement areas. 

               (ii)   The switch devices that are required to control both upper and lower lighting 
fixtures shall be installed at readily accessible locations of the staircase. 

Note: Said lighting fixtures as noted above may be relocated because of the stair case layout 
where it may be necessary to provide sufficient illumination on the general stair tread areas as 
deemed necessary by the building code official and/or the electrical inspector. 

               (iii)   Panel boards that are installed in basement areas shall have a minimum of one (1) 
lighting fixture installed within three feet (3') of the panel board cover. Such light shall not be 
placed upon the other circuits within the basement. It can be placed upon the circuit for the 
required outlet at the panel. 

               (iv)   A minimum of one (1) lighting fixture shall be installed within four feet (4') of the 
furnace and/or heating systems that are installed in basement areas. 

               (v)   A minimum of one (1) lighting fixture shall be installed over any laundry tub or 
laundry equipment that is located and/or installed in any basement area. 

Note: In installations where the lighting fixture (as required above) are located in areas where 
the illumination is obstructed by ducts, beams, etc., said lighting fixtures may require relocation 
and/or lighting fixtures may be required as per the electrical inspector approval. 

               (vi)   In addition to the lighting fixtures as required there shall be additional lighting 
installed to provide a minimum of one (1) foot candle of illumination per square foot 
throughout the entire basement area. 

               (vii)   The entire basement lighting scheme shall not be connected to one (1) individual 
circuit or phase. The lighting fixtures shall be evenly divided and/or separated as to be 
connected to more than one (1) individual circuit and on different phases. 

210.70(E) Add new section as follows: 

210.70(E) Outdoor Lighting Fixtures. 

            (1)   A minimum of one (1) out of door weatherproofed lighting fixture shall be installed 
on the exterior of the structure at each of the front, rear and side entrances to any single family 
dwelling, condominium, apartment unit and/or complex, townhouse type structure and 



1344038.1 
37 

multifamily type structure. They shall be switched from within the main building structure of 
the dwelling complex, apartment unit or townhouse etc. 

            (2)   A minimum of one (1) switched out of door weatherproofed lighting fixture shall be 
installed on the exterior of all structures such as patios, balconies, sun rooms and screened in 
porch for the purpose of providing illuminations in the immediate area of the entrance and/or 
exit to these areas. 

            (3)   Switching devices that are required for these exterior lighting fixtures shall be in a 
readily accessible location, within the building not to exceed two (2) feet from the entrance 
and/or exit areas of the residential structure. 

Note: Where the switching device(s) is installed in rooms and/or areas that may be subject to 
weather conditions it shall be installed in a weatherproofed enclosure. And - out of doors 
lighting fixtures that are installed in an apartment unit and/or apartment complex, 
condominium, or a multi-family type structure may not be required to be switched providing 
that said lighting fixtures are controlled by a photo cell or timing device and the circuit(s) 
originate from a public panel board. 

210.70(F) Add new section as follows: 

210.70(F) Fixtures Over Sinks. 

            (1)   A switched lighting fixture is required and shall be installed over any kitchen sink(s), 
bathroom sink(s), etc. 

Note: A switching device that is installed and/or manufactured in any lighting fixture shall not 
be approved as the required switching arrangement. 

            (2)   An approved switching device to control the operation of said lighting fixtures shall 
be located and/or installed in the wall a minimum of twelve (12) inches and a maximum of 
twenty-four (24) inches from the end line of any kitchen and/or bathroom sink(s). 

            (3)   Switches to control the operation of lighting fixtures and/or any other electrically 
operated device shall not be located and/or installed within two feet (2) of shower stalls, bath 
tubs, whirlpools, etc. 

210.70(G) Add new section as follows: 

210.70(G) Commercial/Industrial Outlets. 

            (1)   In all commercial and industrial buildings, a minimum of one switched lighting 
fixture shall be required for any office, ware-house area, sales area, etc. 

Note: Where an office and/or warehouse area has more than one entrance and/or exit, three 
way switching shall be installed. 



1344038.1 
38 

Exception: Switched lighting fixtures may not be required providing sufficient illumination is 
maintained from unswitched lighting fixtures that are served from dedicated night lighting 
circuits. Said lighting circuit shall have a lock out device installed on the circuit breaker. 

            (2)   All switching devices installed in any commercial and/or industrial structure, shall be 
a minimum of twenty (20) ampere rated. 

210.70(H) Add new section as follows: 

210.70(H) Special Use Rooms. In all utility rooms, furnace rooms, refrigeration equipment 
rooms, areas housing electrical equipment, fire pump rooms, emergency generators, 
mechanical system rooms, etc. the lighting circuit serving said rooms shall be on a separate 
circuit from all other circuits in said rooms. 

210.70(I) Add new section as follows: 

210.70(I) Potential Sleeping Quarters. In all residential applications, any rooms, bonus rooms, 
loft or spare room that can be easily utilized as a sleeping room, whether temporary or 
permanent other than walk in closets of less than 70 square feet, as deemed by a code official 
shall comply with all applicable codes including smoke alarm protection. 

210.70(J) Add new section as follows: 

210.70(J) Central Vacuum Systems. Central vacuum systems electrical contact points providing 
power to vacuum attachments shall be 24 volts or less. 

210.70(K) Add new section as follows: 

210.70(K) Switched Receptacles. Switched receptacles in residential applications shall be 
identified at the receptacle with a factory installed marking. 

Prior to any service work being performed, contact Commonwealth Edison or your electrical 
energy supplier for their rules and regulations. 

Figure 230.1 Services. The provisions of the 20232008 version of the nNational Eelectrical 
Ccode (NFPA 70) for this section are adopted and are further amended by the adoption of the 
additional following language: 

Figure 230.1 Services. The load on any service entrance conductor, main service disconnect 
switchgear and panel boards shall not exceed eighty (80) percent of the rating of the service 
entrance conductor or the main service disconnect means, switchgear or panel boards. 

A 100 amp service shall have 3 #3 copper conductors installed in 11/4 inch heavy wall with a #8 
copper ground in 1/2 inch EMT. 

A 200 amp service shall have 3 #2-0 copper conductors installed in 2 inch heavy wall with a #4 
copper ground in 3/4 inch EMT. 

230.2 Services. Amend this section as follows: 



1344038.1 
39 

230.2 Services. Where more than one set of service conductors is permitted by approval of the 
authority having jurisdiction, or in any existing prior to the adoption of the code, a permanent 
plaque and/or diagram mounted in a plexiglas enclosure shall be installed at each service drop 
or lateral or at each service equipment location designating all other services on or in that 
building or structure. 

(A) Special Conditions. Additional services shall be permitted to supply the following: 

   (1)   Fire pumps. 

   (2)   Emergency systems. 

   (3)   Legally required standby systems. 

   (4)   Optional standby systems. 

   (5)   Parallel power production systems. 

   (6)   Systems designed for connection to multiple sources of supply for the purpose of 
enhanced reliability. 

(B) Special Occupancies. By special permission, additional services shall be permitted for either 
of the following: 

   (1)   Multiple occupancy buildings where there is no available space for service equipment 
accessible to all occupants. 

   (2)   A single building or other structure sufficiently large to make two or more services 
necessary. 

(C) Capacity Requirements. Additional services shall be permitted under any of the following: 

   (1)   Where the capacity requirements are in excess of 2,000 amperes at a supply voltage of 
600 volts or less. 

   (2)   Where the load requirements of a single-phase installation are greater than the serving 
agency normally supplies through one service. 

   (3)   By special permission. 

(D) Different Characteristics. Additional services shall be permitted for different voltages, 
frequencies, or for different uses, such as for different rate schedules. 

(E) Identification. Where a building or structure is supplied by more than one service, or any 
combination of branch circuits, feeders, and services, a permanent plaque or directory shall be 
installed at each service disconnect location denoting all other services, feeders, and branch 
circuits supplying that building or structure and the area served by each. See 225.37. 

(F) Multiple Services. No single family residential occupancy or property shall have more than 
one (1) service installed. No exceptions. 



1344038.1 
40 

(Ord. O-31-10, 5-24-2010) 

   J.   Illinois Plumbing Code: 

      1.   Code Adopted: The current edition of the Illinois Sstate Pplumbing Ccode (77 Ill. adm. 
code 890) promulgated by the Illinois department of public health is hereby adopted as the 
plumbing code of the vVillage of Forest Park, to establish regulations for the minimum control 
of plumbing materials and fixtures, and for the design, construction and installation of 
plumbing systems in the village, and each and all of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and 
terms of the Illinois state plumbing code, promulgated by the Illinois department of public 
health are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set forth in this 
section as amended by the local amendments set forth in subsection J2 of this section. 

      2.   Amendments: 

Required Use Of Water Sense Products. Pursuant to 17 Ill. admin. code 3730.307(c)(4) and 
subject to the Illinois plumbing code (77 Ill. admin. code 890) and the lawn irrigation contractor 
and lawn sprinkler system registration code (77 Ill. admin. code 892), be it hereby ordained that 
in the village of Forest Park, all new and replacement plumbing fixtures and irrigation 
controllers installed after September 30, 2015 shall bear the Water Sense label (as designated 
by the U.S. environmental protection agency Water Sense program), when such labeled fixtures 
are available. 

(Ord. O-27-15, 10-26-2015) 

   K.   Illinois Accessibility Code: 

      1.   Code Adopted: The Illinois Aaccessibility Ccode, 20181997 edition, as published in 
20181997 by state of Illinois, is adopted as the accessibility code of the vVillage of Forest Park in 
the state of Illinois, for the control of accessibility to buildings and structures as herein 
provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of the 
Illinois aAccessibility cCode, 20181997 edition, are referred to, adopted and made a part 
hereof, as if fully set out in this subsection. (Ord. O-22-10, 5-24-2010) 

 Section 3. The corporate authorities of the Village intend that this Ordinance will be 

made part of the Village Code and that sections of this Ordinance can be renumbered or relettered 

and can be changed to “Section,” “Article,” Chapter” or some other appropriate word or phrase to 

accomplish codification, and typographical errors can be corrected with the authorization of the 

Village Attorney, or his or her designee. 

 Section 4. All parts of the Village Code in conflict with the terms or provisions of this 

Ordinance shall be and the same are hereby amended or repealed to the extent of such conflict, 



1344038.1 
41 

and said Village Code and all other existing ordinances shall otherwise remain in full force and 

effect. 

 Section 5. If any section, subsection, paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase of this 

Ordinance or any part thereof is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional or invalid or ineffective 

by any court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity or effectiveness 

of the remaining portions of this Ordinance, or any part thereof.  The corporate authorities hereby 

declare that they would have passed each section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, 

clause or phrase thereof irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, 

subdivisions, paragraphs, sentences, clauses or phrases be declared unconstitutional, invalid or 

ineffective. 

Section 6. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect upon its passage, approval 

and publication in pamphlet form as provided by law. 

 PASSED by the Council of the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois this 15th day 

of December, 2025.  

AYES:       
NAYS:       
ABSENT:    
 

APPROVED by me this 15th day of December, 2025. 
 
 
 
   ___________________________________ 

Rory E. Hoskins, Mayor  
 

ATTESTED and filed in my office, 
and published in pamphlet form 
this ______ day of December, 2025. 
 
 
________________________________ 
Megan Roach, Deputy Village Clerk 



1341631.1 

ORDINANCE NO. O-______________-25 
 
 

AN ORDINANCE WAIVING BID, APPROVING AND AUTHORIZING THE 
EXECUTION OF A MAINTENANCE AGREEMENT WITH SEPS, INC. FOR A 

POLICE DEPARTMENT UNINTERRUPTED POWER SUPPLY (UPS) UNIT 
 
 

 WHEREAS, Section 1-8A-5A of the Village Code of the Village of Forest Park authorizes 

the corporate authorities of the Village of Forest Park (“Village”) to waive, by fourth-fifths vote 

of the corporate authorities, the competitive bidding requirements of the Village Code; and 

 WHEREAS, the corporate authorities of the Village find it advisable, necessary and in the 

best interest of the public to waive the competitive bidding requirements of Section 1-8A-5A of 

the Village Code and approve and authorize the execution of a maintenance agreement 

(“Agreement”) with SEPS, Inc. (“SEPS”) for the Police Department UPS unit.  

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and City Council of the Village 

of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, as follows: 

 Section 1. The facts and statements contained in the preambles to this Ordinance are 

found to be true and correct and are hereby adopted as part of this Ordinance. 

 Section 2. Pursuant to the provisions of Section 1-8A-5A of the Village Code, the 

corporate authorities hereby waive advertising for competitive bids and approve and authorize the 

Village Administrator’s execution of the Agreement with SEPS for the maintenance of the UPS 

unit, a copy of which is attached hereto as Exhibit A and made a part hereof. 

[REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK] 

  



1341631.1 

 Section 3. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect upon its adoption as provided 

by law. 

 PASSED by the Council of the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois this 15th day 

of December, 2025. 

 
AYES:         
 
NAYS:         
 
ABSENT:         
 
        APPROVED: 
 
 

______________________________ 
        Rory E. Hoskins, Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
 
_______________________________ 
Megan Roach, Deputy Village Clerk 

 
 

  



1341631.1 

EXHIBIT A 
AGREEMENT 

 
 



1341631.1 



1341631.1 



1341631.1 



1341631.1 



1341631.1 



1341631.1 



1341631.1 



1341631.1 



1341631.1 



1341631.1 

 



1344025.1 

RESOLUTION NO. R-___________-25 
 

A RESOLUTION APPROVING AND DIRECTING THE VILLAGE ENGINEER TO 
PREPARE AND SUBMIT A PRE-APPLICATION FOR THE 

METROPOLITAN WATER RECLAMATION DISTRICT OF GREATER CHICAGO 
GREEN INFRASTRUCTURE PARTNERSHIP PROGRAM 

 
WHEREAS, the Village of Forest Park (the “Village”) desires to make certain public 

improvements for the 2026 Green Alley Project – 600 Block Thomas/Hannah Alley (the 

“Project”);  

WHEREAS, the Metropolitan Water Reclamation District of Greater Chicago (the 

“MWRD”) provides opportunities for grant funding to local agencies for green infrastructure in 

the MWRD Green Infrastructure Partnership Program; and 

WHEREAS, in the opinion of a majority of the corporate authorities of the Village, it is 

advisable, necessary and in the public interest that the Village authorize and direct Christopher B. 

Burke Engineering, Ltd. (the “Village Engineer”) to prepare and submit the pre-application to the 

MWRD for grant funding for the Project;  

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Council of the Village of 

Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, as follows: 

Section 1. The statements contained in the preambles to this resolution are found to be 

true and correct and are hereby adopted as part of this resolution. 

Section 2. It is hereby determined that it is advisable, necessary and in the public 

interest that the Village direct the Village Engineer to submit a pre-application to the MWRD for 

participation in its Green Infrastructure Partnership Program for the Project. 

Section 3. The Village’s pre-application to the MWRD Green Infrastructure 

Partnership Program by the Village Engineer is hereby approved. 



1344025.1 

Section 4. The corporate authorities of the Village hereby authorize and direct the 

Village Engineer to prepare and submit the pre-application to the MWRD for the Village’s 

participation in its Green Infrastructure Partnership Program for the Project. 

Section 5. The officers and employees of the Village shall take all action necessary or 

reasonably required by the parties to carry out, give effect to and consummate the intent of this 

resolution. 

Section 6. This Resolution shall be in full force and effect upon its passage and 

approval in accordance with law. 

 ADOPTED by the Council of the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois this 15th 

day of December, 2025.  

 
 AYES: ___________________________ 
 
 NAYS: ___________________________ 
 
 ABSENT: _________________________  
 

APPROVED by me this 15th day of December, 2025. 
 
 
 
   ___________________________________ 

Rory E. Hoskins, Mayor  
 
 

ATTESTED and filed in my office, 
and published in pamphlet form 
this ______ day of December, 2025. 
 
 
________________________________ 
Megan Roach, Deputy Village Clerk  
  



1344025.1 

EXHIBIT A 
 

2026 GREEN ALLEY MWRD PRE-APPLICATION 
600 BLOCK THOMAS/HANNAH ALLEY 



1344025.1 



1344025.1 



1344025.1 



1344025.1 



1344025.1 



1344025.1 



1344025.1 



1344025.1 



1344025.1 

 



1344025.1 



1344025.1 

 



1344024.1 

RESOLUTION NO. R - ____________ - 25 
 

A RESOLUTION APPROVING THE 2026 AGREEMENT WITH 
ENDEAVOR EDWARD-ELMHURST OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH SERVICES  

FOR A SUBSTANCE ABUSE RANDOM MANAGEMENT PROGRAM  
IN THE VILLAGE OF FOREST PARK, ILLINOIS 

 
 WHEREAS, Endeavor Edward-Elmhurst Occupational Health Services ("Endeavor") 
provides substance abuse random testing services; and 
 
 WHEREAS, it is in the best interest of the residents of the Village of Forest Park (the 
“Village”) for the Village to enter into a Substance Abuse Random Management Program 
Agreement (the “Agreement”) with Endeavor to provide substance abuse random testing services 
for employees of the Village for 2026. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the Village of Forest Park, 
Cook County, Illinois, as follows: 
 
 Section 1. That the Mayor is hereby authorized and directed to execute the 
Agreement with Endeavor in substantially the form attached hereto as Exhibit A, with such 
changes as may be approved by the officials executing the same, their execution thereof to 
constitute conclusive evidence of their approval of such changes. 
 
 Section 2. That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect upon and after its 
passage in the manner provided by law. 
 

ADOPTED by the Council of the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois this 15th 
day of December, 2025. 
 
AYES:  ______________________________________________ 
NAYS:  ______________________________________________ 
ABSENT: ____________________________________________ 
 
 APPROVED by me this 15th day of December, 2025. 
             
      

___________________________________ 
      Rory E. Hoskins, Mayor 
 
ATTESTED and filed in my office, 
and published in pamphlet form 
This _____ day of December, 2025. 
 
 
_________________________________ 
Megan Roach, Deputy Village Clerk 



1344024.1 

EXHIBIT A 
 

Agreement with Edward-Elmhurst Occupational Health Services 
2026 Substance Abuse Random Management Program Agreement 



1344024.1 

 



1343769-1 

RESOLUTION NO. R-________-25 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE VILLAGE OF FOREST PARK, ILLINOIS, 
AUTHORIZING AND DIRECTING THE TRANSFER OF FUNDS FROM 

THE ROOSEVELT ROAD/HANNAH AVENUE TIF DISTRICT 
TO THE ROOSEVELT ROAD CORRIDOR TIF DISTRICT 

 
 BE IT RESOLVED by the Village Council of the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, 

Illinois, as follows: 

 Section 1. The Finance Director of the Village of Forest Park, or her designee, is 

hereby authorized and directed to transfer all unencumbered, unrestricted and/or unobligated 

funds in the Special Tax Allocation Fund of the Roosevelt Road/Hannah Avenue TIF District to 

the Special Tax Allocation Fund of the Roosevelt Road Corridor TIF District. 

 Section 2. The Village officials, officers, employees, consultants and agents are 

directed and authorized to take all such actions reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose and 

intent of this Resolution 

Section 3. This Resolution shall be in full force and effect upon its passage in the 

manner provided by law. 

 PASSED by the Council of the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois this 15th day 
of December, 2025. 

 
AYES:  ___________________ 
 
NAYS:  ___________________ 
 
ABSENT:  _________________ 
 
 APPROVED by me this 15th day of December, 2025. 
 
  
        
 ___________________________________ 
       Rory E. Hoskins, Mayor 
 
ATTESTED and filed in my office, 
and published in pamphlet form 
this _______ day of December, 2025. 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
Megan Roach, Deputy Village Clerk 



1344036_1   

RESOLUTION NO. R- ____ -25 
 

A RESOLUTION APPROVING A 2026 PARATRANSIT SERVICE  
PROVIDER AGREEMENT BETWEEN SUBURBAN BUS DIVISION  

OF THE REGIONAL TRANSPORTATION AUTHORITY (PACE)  
AND THE VILLAGE OF FOREST PARK  

 
 WHEREAS, the Village has previously entered into a Paratransit Service Provider 
Agreement with the Suburban Bus Division of the Regional Transportation Authority (PACE) 
which expires on December 31, 2025; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the corporate authorities of the Village of Forest Park deem it to be in the 
best interest of the residents of Forest Park to maintain and operate a public bus service known as 
the PACE “Dial-A-Ride Bus Service” for the elderly and disabled for all service hours, as well 
as for members of the general public for limited hours and limited destinations. 
 
 WHEREAS, the Village of Forest Park and the Suburban Bus Division of the Regional 
Transportation Authority (PACE) have agreed to enter into a service provider agreement to 
obtain public bus service within the Village of Forest Park for the year 2026 in exchange for the 
payment of operating, capital and other expenses; and  
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Council of the Village of 
Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, as follows: 
 
 Section 1. That certain 2026 Paratransit Service Provider Agreement by and between 
Suburban Bus Division of the Regional Transportation Authority (PACE) and the Village of 
Forest Park, a copy of which is attached hereto as Exhibit A, is hereby authorized and approved.   
 
 Section 2. The Mayor and the Village Clerk are hereby authorized and directed to 
execute and attest, respectively, said 2026 Paratransit Service Provider Agreement. 
 

Resolved this 15th day of December, 2025. 
 

AYES: ___________________________ 
NAYS: __________________________ 
ABSENT: _________________________ 
 
APPROVED by me this 15th day of December, 2025. 
 
 

     ____________________________________ 
Rory E. Hoskins, Mayor   

ATTESTED and filed in my office, 
and published in pamphlet form 
this ______ day of December, 2025. 
 
 
________________________________ 
Megan Roach, Deputy Village Clerk 



1344036_1   

EXHIBIT A 
 

2026 Paratransit Service Provider Agreement 



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   



1344036_1   

 



1341528-1 

RESOLUTION NO. R-__________-25 
 

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE APPROVAL OF 
PAY REQUEST #9 FOR THE AMI WATER METERS 

REPLACEMENT PROJECT TO VEREGY CENTRAL, LLC 
 

 WHEREAS, the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois ("Village"), awarded the 

contract for the AMI Water Meters Replacement Project ("Project") to Veregy Central, LLC 

(“Contractor"); and 

 WHEREAS, Contractor has submitted its Pay Request #9 for completed work to date 

under the Project, a copy of which is attached hereto and made a part hereof; and 

 WHEREAS, the Pay Request #9 has been reviewed by Village staff, who have 

determined that Contractor is entitled to compensation for certain services performed under the 

Project, pursuant to the Pay Request #9; and 

 WHEREAS, the Village will be obligated to make a payment on Pay Request #9 to 

Contractor in the amount of Two Hundred Sixty-Two Thousand Two Hundred and 44/100 

Dollars ($262,200.44); and 

 WHEREAS, it is necessary that the Mayor and Council of the Village approve Pay 

Request #9 to Contractor under the contract for the Project. 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Mayor and Council of the Village of 

Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois, as follows: 

 Section 1. The Council of the Village hereby approves Pay Request #9 to Contractor 

in the amount of Two Hundred Sixty-Two Thousand Two Hundred and 44/100 Dollars 

($262,200.44) under the contract for the Project with Contractor. 

 Section 2. The Village Clerk is directed to attest to the Mayor's signature on any and 

all documents, as necessary. 



1341528-1 

 Section 3. This Resolution shall be in full force and effect upon its passage and 

adoption in accordance with law. 

 ADOPTED by the Council of the Village of Forest Park, Cook County, Illinois this 15th 

day of December, 2025.  

 
 AYES: ___________________________ 
 
 NAYS: ___________________________ 
 
 ABSENT: _________________________  
 

APPROVED by me this 15th day of December, 2025. 
 
 
 
   ___________________________________ 

Rory E. Hoskins, Mayor  
 
 

ATTESTED and filed in my office, 
and published in pamphlet form 
this ______ day of December, 2025. 
 
 
________________________________ 
Megan Roach, Deputy Village Clerk  
  
 
 



1341528-1 

VEREGY CENTRAL, LLC 
AMI WATER METERS REPLACEMENT PROJECT 

PAY REQUEST #9 

 



1341528-1 



1341528-1 



1341528-1 



1341528-1 



1341528-1 



1341528-1 



1341528-1 

 










	121525 Agenda.pdf
	minutes 112425
	THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE COUNCIL OF THE
	VILLAGE OF FOREST PARK, COOK COUNTY, ILLINOIS
	HELD ON MONDAY EVENING, NOVEMBER 24, 2025
	ROLL CALL
	Commissioners Maxham, Nero, Melin-Rogovin, Voogd and Mayor Hoskins answered the Roll Call.
	APPROVAL OF THE MINUTES OF PREVIOUS MEETINGS
	AYES: Commissioners Maxham, Nero, Melin-Rogovin, Voogd and Mayor Hoskins
	APPROVAL OF BILLS:
	AYES: Commissioners Maxham, Nero, Melin-Rogovin, Voogd and Mayor Hoskins
	AYES: Commissioners Maxham, Nero, Melin-Rogovin, Voogd and Mayor Hoskins
	NAYES: None

	December 15 2025 Bills by Resolution
	12.15.pdf
	12.15-1.pdf

	VA Memo
	1 Forest Park Arts Alliance Presentation 12.15.2025 no video.pptx
	2a 2025 tax levy memo
	2b 2025 Tax Levy Ordinance
	3ab Resolution Directing the County Clerk to Calculate Separate Limiting Rates for the tax levy  2025
	4a GlinkeCodeUpdate2025Memo
	4b B and F Code overview 2018 - 2024
	Office & Shipping:
	2420 Vantage Drive
	Correspondence:

	F
	B
	Phone


	4cForest Park Ordinance amending Section 8-1-1, Entitled _Building Codes Adoption,_ of the Code of the Village of Forest Park(1344038.1)
	5 Forest Park Ordinance waiving bids and approving and authorizing the execution of a maintenance agreement with SEPS, Inc. for a Police Department Uninterru
	APPROVED:
	ATTEST:

	6 Forest Park Resolution Approving and Directing the Village Engineer to Prepare and Submit Application to the Metropolitan Water Reclamation District of Gre
	7 Forest Park Resolution Approving the 2026 Agreement with Endeavor Edward-Elmhurst Occupational Health Services for a Substance Abuse Random Management Testi
	AYES:  ______________________________________________
	NAYS:  ______________________________________________
	APPROVED by me this 15th day of December, 2025.

	8 Forest Park Resolution authorizing and directing the transfer of funds from the Roosevelt Road_Hannah Avenue TIF District to the Roosevelt Road Corridor TIF
	9 Resolution approving 2026 PACE agreement(1344036.1)
	10 Forest Park Resolution authorizing approval of pay request #9 for AMI Water Meters Replacement Project to Veregy Central, LLC(1341528.1)
	11 Toy Drive-Raffle Application



